
Diversity: What Schools Leave Out

Edward L. Whitfield

January, 2004

Jubilee Institute Pre-Print Series  #3  © 2004  Edward L. Whitfield  $10.00
Jubilee Institute - PO Box 875 - Greensboro, NC - 27406 - (336) 230-0001

www.belovedcommunitycenter.org



2

Cover picture:

In Little Rock Arkansas in 1957, nine children were confronted with the Ar-
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They were fighting “real” segregation.
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Introduction

This is a collection of essays, speeches newspaper columns and poetry written during
the last 6 years, or so. Everything written here is concrete and about something that
was taking place at the time. The dates are included where possible so that the pieces
can be considered in their specificity. I recognize that some of the things that are de-
scribed here have changed somewhat since these documents were written, but I still
think that the complete picture that they represent is still essentially sound and is in
fact, a coherent way to look at educational issues related to community, diversity,
and the world we live in.

While many of the pieces here might be controversial, They come from about 40
years of engaging with people in the community about what they think about the
educational system as well as considerable amounts of reading and reflection on the
questions at hand. These pieces represent my best synthesis and my best thinking and
I have always been willing to think “outside the box “

For those who think that these views represent giving up on integration and diversity,
I want to register my disagreement up front: The goal of a truly fair, wholesome,
supportive society where people approach their potential is indeed my goal. The
problem is that too many of the things that are being done in the name of that goal
simply don’t make sense to me when examined dispassionately. I also think that the
answer to any problem comes from looking closely at the problem itself. In this
sense, this is a thoroughly optimistic view of what we need to be doing. We have to
set it in our minds, however not to simply continue to do what we are doing even
when we see that it is not working and children are suffering.

Finally, I want to say a word about who I am: I am a social activist, musician,
mathematician, philosopher and essayist. I have written for newspapers, magazines,
and community groups on questions of education as well as peace and justice.
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On the Question of Diversity

A Brief Look at the Down Side of the Struggle for Diversity in Public Educa-
tion

The Price of Diversity

Those of us who support neighborhood schools know that there is an argument to be
made for diversity. People can and should learn from each other. Cross-cultural
contact is an important part of the overall educational process and is very important
in a multicultural society. But as we seek these advantages we must ask the price.
Certainly it would be unfair to Black children if we required them to accept the status
of lab experiments, to be studied and examined for the benefit of white children's
education. Certainly it would be unfair to them if we required that they always ex-
plain or defend the actions and attitudes of all the other members of their race. Cer-
tainly it would be unfair to them if we consistently put them in situations where the
economic disparity between their communities and others was an ongoing source of
ridicule. Certainly in would be unfair for us to force them to go to schools so far out
of their communities that they felt alienated, isolated and unloved. The sad fact is
that we have done all these things and more in the name of diversity.

The busing of children from the area around English Village and Morningside
Homes to Claxton elementary school borders on being criminal. Small children from
the poorest part of Greensboro took long bus rides each morning to the wealthiest
part of Greensboro. There, too many of them were made to feel insecure, inadequate
and unloved in a remote, hostile and unfamiliar surrounding. The parents of these
children felt uncomfortable on those occasions when they could find a way to the
school to be involved with the children. How do children who didn't get to go to Em-
erald Point during the summer talk about their vacations with those who spent the
summer on the Riviera? It isn't fair, and it isn't necessary.

Building True Understanding

We need to know, that it is not simply contact between people, but rather, it is the
interaction of different people as equals that builds understanding and respect be-
tween the races.

During slavery there was a considerable amount of contact at all levels (economic,
social, and personal intimacy) between Blacks and whites, yet no mutual respect
emerged. Each party acted out his role in a historically staged play with the predict-
able consequence that everyone's preconceived notion was reinforced by what he
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saw. Relations of power and domination generated the inequity of the interaction. It
was like actors standing behind their masks in a Greek play where their real features
and their real humanity was invisible to the audience and to themselves. This is
pretty much what has been observed in many of the relations developed in public
schools in the period of forced busing. White students and teachers who think of
Black people as lazy and ignorant have been reinforced in that self-fulfilling percep-
tion by what they saw in these institutions that they had created for themselves. To
the extent that many Black youth felt alienated and abused by the educational sys-
tem, whites saw their behavior in response to this as proof of the existing stereo-
types. Black people, who felt that whites were hostile, insensitive and deceptive, felt
justified with their observance of the conduct of many white students playing out
those roles.

The interaction as equals, that builds true understanding and respect between people,
is only possible when our youth have a sense of their own identity and the tools and
skills to succeed. They must feel self-confident, socially aware and have their crea-
tive energies unleashed. Supportive and nurturing neighborhood schools play a role
in creating the atmosphere in which this can take place. We will need to develop
more situations and processes where people do come into contact with each other as
equals. This may include athletic competition, extramural academic interaction, cul-
tural expositions and conscious dialog sessions. The public schools have so far
proven not to be very good at this. The task of creating opportunities for interaction
as equals may be difficult at first, given the history of racism, cultural isolation and
cultural chauvinism. But it can and must be worked out.

The Problem with Magnet Schools

Magnet schools have been raised as a means of developing diversity without coer-
cion, but they too present many serious problems. Magnet schools were developed as
a method of achieving integration without forced busing. The idea was to create "su-
per schools" using the latest innovation, best teachers and best resources and put
these schools inside the Black community to attract white students. Seats in these
schools were set aside for the white students who were being sought. It is ironic that
one of the results of a struggle by Black people for access to better educational re-
sources for their children was the establishment of institutions, in the Black commu-
nity, that are not concerned with better educating Black children, but rather serve
only the purpose of attracting white children.

There were instances where quotas were established and Black children were ex-
cluded from magnet school programs in their communities with empty seats for the
purpose of saving spaces for white children who did not want to go. This was the in-
sanity of using segregation - the forceful exclusion of some children because of their
race - to fight for integration - the mixing of Black and white children in school
buildings. It never made any sense, but when it was questioned, the response was
that the federal guidelines required it.
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Two things are fundamentally wrong with the magnet school concept: First, if we
know better what children really need for their education, we have a responsibility to
provided it for all the children, not just for a select few who get into magnet pro-
grams. Second, it obviously makes no sense at all to seek to correct the exclusion of
Black children from better educational opportunities by excluding them from the best
schools that are placed in Black communities to attract white children. The results of
the magnet process are as ridiculous as the assumptions upon which it rests. We end
up with two separate schools, one overwhelmingly Black and poor, the other major-
ity white and affluent, with different teachers and different classrooms for different
students all housed under one roof, sharing only toilet and lunch facilities.

Going Hungry is Not Good Preparation for Famine

Another argument some people will make for diversity is that it will prepare our
children for the problems they will face as adults. The idea that we should throw our
children into hostile educational environment s at an early age so they can learn to
deal with the racism and animosity of the society is pure foolishness. You don't pre-
pare for a famine by fasting. All that might do is condition you to the pain you will
encounter but it will not give you the stored up nutrition that will allow you to make
it through it. If you know you are going where food is scarce, it is better to overeat
for a while.

Our children will see enough real racism, discrimination and isolation in the world as
adults. As children we need to fill them so full of themselves that they are self-
confident and no one can make them doubt themselves. That is why the idea of a
wholesome, nurturing educational environment controlled by the community is so
important. When our children face the irrationality and insanity of the society, they
should question the society and not themselves. It is out of creatively questioning the
society with a deep sense of commitment and responsibility to our community that
we can inspire the thinking required to answer to the question "how do we fix what is
wrong?"
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A Children's Story:

On the Mountaintop Preparation for Living Down in the Valley

 4/5/99

Once upon a time there was a group of children. They lived with their families down
in the valley. There were many things they did down in the valley that no one did
anywhere else. When they were down in the valley, they played valley games. When
they were in the valley, they ate valley food. When they were in the valley they
talked valley talk. And when they were in the valley they walked a special valley
walk that no one who lived outside the valley ever walked.

If the people in the valley looked up and to the west, they could see high upon the
mountain nearby. Up on the mountain, they could faintly make out the shapes of the
mountain people and their children. "I wonder," said some of the people in the valley
"if it would be alright for us to go up on the top of the mountain, too." And so, some
of them took up the difficult task of climbing to the top of the mountain to take a
look.

When the mountain people saw the valley people coming up the hill, most of them
didn't like it. One of them tried to make a name for himself by standing in the
mountain pass and saying he would never let them up to the top of the mountain.
Some of them pushed the valley people back down to the bottom of the mountain
and would not let them get up. Some of the mountain people caught valley people
and hurt them and did unspeakably mean things to them to maintain the purity of the
mountaintop. The valley people fought long and hard to be able to get to the top of
the mountain.

Not all of the mountain people were mean like that. A few mountain people even de-
cided that it was OK for the people in the valley to come up to the top of the moun-
tain. They helped some of the valley people who were trying to get up to the top. Fi-
nally, after years of struggle, and with the help of some of the people from the
mountain, a few valley people made it to the top of the mountain. The valley people
thought they were free at last from the valley and they celebrated. Once they had
made it to the top of the mountain, some of the valley people decided they wanted to
stay on the top of the mountain. Other valley people had their curiosity satisfied and
went back down to their homes at the bottom of the valley.

The people at the top of the mountain were a little different from the valley people.
While it is true, that there were some mountain people who helped the valley people
up the mountain, even those mountain people didn't want the valley people to bring
their valley ways up the mountain with them. "Now, those things are alright down in
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the valley," the mountain people would say, "but up here on top of the mountain you
have to act the mountain way to fit in and be accepted." The people from the valley
thought this was strange, particularly coming from many of their new friends who
had helped them get to the top of the mountain. But they wanted to be nice. They
wanted to fit in. So the valley people started to learn as much as they could about the
ways of the mountain.

"You know," some of the mountain people said after a while, "no one should want to
stay down in the valley when they can live up here on the mountain top. Why don't
you send us all of your children so we can teach them the ways of the mountain.
Then, someday, they will be ready to live here on top of the mountain with us and be
accepted. Then, we can all get along."

So the valley people started sending their children to the mountain to learn the ways
of the mountain people so they could fit in and be accepted. Not all of the valley
children liked this. After a while, some of the valley children began to complain:
"Most of the mountain people don't really seem to like us," they said. "Even the ones
who say they like us don't like our ways."

"Oh," said the valley parents, "you will get used to it. You must learn the ways of the
mountaintop. No one should want to stay down here in the valley all the time."

"But there are some nice things here in the valley, too," some of the valley children
complained. "We don't want to give up all our ways just to be on the mountain top.
Why can't we stay here in the valley if we want to, at least until we grow up and are
strong? Then those of us who want to can go to the mountain top and be proud of
who we are instead of begging the mountain people to accept us."

"Just be patient," they were told. "We fought so hard to get to the top of the moun-
tain. We fought so hard."

It wasn't long though before most of the valley children and most of their parents
were saying the same thing. They didn't have to spend a lot of time on top of the
mountain before they understood that there were some good and some bad things in
the valley and there were some good and some bad things on the top of the mountain.
But there was a problem.

Some of the valley people who had fought hard to get to the top of the mountain
were determined that everyone needed to go there. They didn't want to hear about
anyone wanting to stay in the valley. "The valley is not a good place. There is more
food on the top of the mountain. There are bigger houses on top of the mountain.
They talk a different talk on the top of the mountain, so the mountain talk must be
better. They play different games on top of the mountain and they must be more fun.
They walk a different walk on top of the mountain. We must be sure our children
learn to walk that walk so they can be accepted and then everyone on top of the
mountain will like them and they will be accepted on top of the mountain."
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The hand full of valley people who didn't like anything about the valley got together
with a few of the mountain people who didn't like the valley people's ways but who
didn't mind a few of them at a time if they knew how to act. Together, they decided
that all of the valley children should come to the mountain and learn the ways of the
mountaintop. After a while, this didn't make much sense at all to most of the valley
people.

So, it was over the objection of most of the people in the valley, that the valley chil-
dren were forced to go to the top of the mountain every day to learn the ways of the
mountaintop and to prepare for life. But, again, there was a problem. Most of the
children from the valley still had to come back to the valley every day.

"They don't give us much credit for what we know," the valley children would say.
"They tell us that all the things we have learned down in the valley are only good for
the valley. They say that those things are not very important, and they are not very
good." This caused a lot of pain and confusion for the valley children. It made them
feel bad when they were told that they were not very smart, just knowing valley
things. They were told that they were not doing very well in catching up with the
mountaintop children. This made them feel bad, too. The valley children were being
taught all about the mountain, but they still had to live in the valley. Some of the
things they were taught on the mountaintop didn't seem to make much difference
where they lived in the valley. More and more, what they learned every day was un-
connected from what they did and what they saw every day. More and more, some of
the valley children looked for ways to avoid the bad times and the useless things they
were learning on the top of the mountain.

When the valley children were in the valley, they had to beware of the valley beasts.
The mountain people did not know about the valley beasts. When they were in the
valley, the valley children had to know how to cook the valley food. The mountain
people did not like the valley food. When they were in the valley, the valley children
had to avoid the valley sinking pits. The mountain people did not know about the
valley sinking pits. When they were in the valley, the valley children needed to know
how to grow the valley fruits. The mountain people did not grow valley fruits on the
top of the mountain. The valley children who were trained on the mountaintop were
not accepted on the mountaintop and became less and less able to survive in the va l-
ley,.

"We have a terrible problem here," the wise people who lived in the valley began to
say. " The mountaintop is not preparing our children well for living in the valley or
on the mountain. They may never get to climb the mountain on their own if they
can't survive the valley beasts, cook the valley food, avoid the sinking pits in the
valley and even grow the valley fruits."

A few valley children were tough and got lucky. They survived the valley and some
of the eventually went on up to the top of the mountain.. Many more valley children
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were not as tough or as lucky. They got eaten alive by the valley beasts or they
starved when they couldn't cook the valley food for themselves and their children.
Many more sank deep and drowned in the valley sinking pits, and others saw their
valley get poorer and poorer as they didn't grow any of the fine fruits that needed to
be grown in the valley.

"We cannot be doing the right thing for our children," the wise valley people finally
said. "Even if they want to climb the mountain some day on their own, they still have
to learn the ways of the valley and learn how to survive in it first. Perhaps some who
go to the top of the mountain will bring us new things back to the valley. Perhaps
some will grow the mountain top fruits in the rich soil of the valley. Perhaps they can
learn the best of the mountaintop and bring it back here to make the valley an even
better place. But it was wrong not to recognize the good things that are here in the
valley too."

"We can learn the mountain talk, but it is no better than our own valley talk. We
could learn the mountain walk, but who wants to walk like that? We need to bring
our children home. Then, we can teach them to understand who they are, and where
they are from and how to make their homes and families better. Then, they can go to
the top of the mountain if they want to, or they can make lush and beautiful homes in
the valley. The choice should be theirs."

So, over the objections of those in the valley who hated the valley and those on top
of the mountain who hated the valley people's ways, the wise people in the valley
began, again, to teach the children in the valley the ways of the valley and the dan-
gers of the valley.

I would like to tell you that they lived happily ever after, but this is a long story and
it is not over yet.

-Not Yet The End-
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A Contribution to the Community Discussion on Education

August 2, 2002

Part I

I think I can make a contribution to the national discussion about schools and school
reform. What I would like to offer is that we start off that discussion at a different
place.

All too often, the discussion on schools starts from the point of what would be good
for "public education" as though that institution was an unquestionable virtue of our
society and anything that damages it damages us all.

Then there are discussions that begin from the point of "student achievement" as
though there was a clear social consensus as to what students, or any one else, for
that matter, should achieve. While measurements on "standardized" instruments are
bandied about, the fundamental discussion of "What should an educated person
know?" is often pushed into the background.   Sometimes useful but vague phrases
like "every child can learn" or "no child left behind" or "helping children reach their
potential" are used. Of course "all children can learn". They do it very well, with no
prodding, for years before they come into any school. "Not leaving them behind" is
perplexing in that it isn't clear where we are going, and a child's potential can only be
looked at in the context of a serious philosophical investigation into the nature and
potential of mankind - a discussion most state legislatures and the US congress do
not engage as they develop national and state wide school policies.

Another less often heard, but equally problematic starting point is from the interest
of teachers, our neighbors who dedicate their lives to the raising of the next genera-
tion. Their needs and interests -- sometimes as organized labor and sometimes as dis-
respected professionals -- is taken as a beginning of the discussion of which "re-
forms" have the most overall efficacy.

I think that the proper starting point is different from all of these and should enlist
the whole community in the discussion of parents, children, the community and the
future. What are the relationships? What is the potential? What are the dreams? What
are the necessities? I believe that all the other questions connected with schooling
and education and funding and equity can be grounded in the discussion of parents,
children, the community and the future. And more than that, I think that none of
these other questions can be looked at very deeply and meaningfully without that
grounding.

What I think good parents really want for their children is for them to be able to be
meaningfully and respectfully involved as full participants of the community now
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and on into the future. I think that the community, those members with children and
those without, have a need for the next generation to be prepared to fully assume the
responsibilities of the leadership, progress, productivity and continuity of the com-
munity. I think children want to live in the present and enjoy themselves as part of
the community even as they learn the possibilities and assume the power of adults
who they imitate as a natural part of growing up.

The essence of what is needed for these things to take place is the wholesome in-
volvement of young people in the active overall life of the community. From this,
young people will learn to do their part much like they learn to talk without ever be-
ing instructed, or graded on their progress.

The question for us, then, is what role do the schools, and what we consider "public
education" in general, play in this taking place on a full and equitable basis? How
can the community as a whole facilitate it taking place? What are we doing right?
What are we doing wrong?

There are a number of complicating factors when these discussions are taken up in a
non-homogeneous (multi-cultural) community with a history of discrimination.
Questions of fairness and equity come to the fore. I once pondered "What is wrong
with the son of a banker wanting to be a banker?" What is wrong with a family in the
retail business? I think we find it problematic if the daughter of a domestic worker
wants to become a maid. I think that we rightly assume that her background serves as
a fetter to her full potential and that as a whole community we need to put more re-
sources and more models at her disposal so that her options also include banking or
retail or medicine.

Communities within communities have their own aspirations that grow out of the
concrete struggles of those communities for dignity freedom and equality. These as-
pirations are part of what you hear when a black child in the south is told that he
needs to get a good education. Part of what is expected is that he learns the skills
needed to fit into the larger culture and economy, but it is also desired that he not
forget where he comes from and becomes a conscious "credit to his community" and
a bridge to help others connect to the larger community. These aspirations to "be
somebody" but "don't forget where you came from" are among the highest aspira-
tions of the black community that I know in the south. They are transmitted through
the family and also through a number of other religious, and social organizations that
form the fabric of daily life. These aspirations were once consciously and explicitly
and deliberately espoused in the segregated Negro schools, too. With the rise of mas-
sive cross-town bussing and the loss of identity of the black schools that is no longer
the case. (Even when the school enrollment is overwhelmingly black, these schools
lose the character of the older black schools because they don't have the leadership of
the black professional class and black teachers that once populated segregated
schools.)
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Part II

There can be no meaningful and fulfilling involvement in the future if that future is
itself meaningless, irrational and alienating.

Paul Goodman, one of the founders of an important school of psychotherapy - Ge-
stalt Therapy -- has gone so far as to suggest that some mental illnesses are them-
selves the response of a creative individual to a repressive or coercive situation.

The only legitimate preparation of young people for this future is to pre-
pare them to fight to change it from what it is toward what it needs to be.
The evaluation of education for that future is the extent to which it pre-
pares youth to be critical, analytical, and fearless. Our schools prepare
young people to be just the opposite.

Bertrand Russell, one of the great English-speaking philosophers of the 20th century
pointed out:

"Certain mental habits are commonly instilled by those who are engaged
in educating: obedience and discipline, ruthlessness in the struggle for
worldly success, contempt towards opposing groups, and an unques-
tioning credulity, a passive acceptance of the teacher's wisdom. All these
habits are against life. Instead of obedience and discipline, we ought to
aim at preserving independence and impulse." (Bertrand Russell  The
Basic Writings of Bertrand Russell)

Paul Goodman is just as harsh in his criticism of what goes on in schools:

"Our entire school system, like our over-organized economy, politics,
and standard of living, is largely a trap; it is not designed for the maxi-
mum growth and future practical utility of the children into a changing
world, that they too will hopefully improve, but is a kind of inept social
engineering to mold, and weed out, for short-range extrinsic needs. And
even when it is more benevolent, it is in the bureaucratic death-grip,
from the universities and the boards of education down, of a uniformity
of conception and method that cannot possibly suit the multitude of dis-
position s and conditions." (Paul Goodman, From John Dewey to A. S.
Neill)

What this means to me is that adults have a responsibility for trying to make the
community a saner, less coercive, less irrational place and in doing so we should en-
list the aid of young people in the here and now. Schools, as we know them, work at
odds with this task. They are more attuned to preparing young people to fit into the
irrationality at some point in the distant future.

John Dewey speaks to this point in his writings:
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"I believe that the only true education comes through the stimulation of
the child's powers by the demands of the social situations in which he
finds himself. . .

I believe that education, therefore, is a process of living and not a prepa-
ration for future living." (John Dewey, Dewey on Education)

Consider a bondsman in the home of a thief.

A major challenge for progressive folks is to look at the aspirations of parents for
their children and see how this fits into the current direction of the country.

In a relatively short period of time, this country has gone from being majority rural,
through being overwhelmingly urban and industrial to being post industrial subur-
ban, and service, informational, commercial, financial based. (It is a little hard to
figure out the basis for the country these days)

How do we move forward in the future? How should our children be prepared for
this existence?

How should we relate to our neighbors around the world?

What should also be added to this description of the basis for the country is that we
live in a period of massive "globalization" and in many ways the consolidation of an
American Empire where the entire world is being molded to the economic needs and
interest of the most powerful in this country.

The role of the military around the world in terms of coercing people world-wide
into economic and political relationships beneficial to the most powerful here needs
to be looked at in connection to what it means for the future of our youth. Military
expenditures and the effect that they have on the overall economy as well as how
they are related to the overall division of the social product, cannot be ignored.

The police function and growth of prison/industrial complex required for social con-
trol given the wide and growing disparity between the "haves" and the "have-nots"
domestically needs to be looked at.

The huge black market economy in drugs - its complex and near complete distortion
of the economic realities of American society and the consequent social problems
that are connected to them need to be understood.

The loss of jobs in manufacturing and even in commerce and finance due to the in-
creased efficiency of computerized equipment leading to a shrinking base of con-
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sumers for a growing number of goods and services need to be analyzed and under-
stood.

The Educational system needs to address all these realities of our community and the
future. Is Education best handled by these existing specialized institutions, or is it
best taken up as a community based - non-institutional function? The question that
needs to be asked is how will we facilitate our young people taking their rightful
place of responsibility and leadership in this complex world? Do our schools do that
well? Is the reason that they do not do it well simply the lack of money, or would
more money allow them mainly to do even better the harm to children that they are
doing now?

There was a jingle I heard a lot when I was growing up about "Blue Bonnet Marga-
rine". It went "Everything's better with Blue Bonnet On It". There is a part of the
American Myth that sounds a lot like that jingle and is just about as "true": "Every-
thing's Better With More Money On It."

The idea that the ills of education flow from the shortage of funds presupposes that
the existing institutions are trying to do the right things but just don't have the re-
sources. Paul Goodman, Everett Reimer, John Holt and Ivan Illich have a different
view that Goodman sums up this way:

"When, at a meeting, I offer that perhaps we already have too much for-
mal schooling and that, under present conditions, the more we get the
less education we will get, the others look at me oddly and proceed to
discuss how to get more money for schools and how to upgrade the
schools. I realize suddenly that I am confronting a mass superstition."

A note on home schooling

Home Schooling does not mean replicating the School in the home. It is strongest
when it recognizes the natural learning process that takes place for years before
school starts and is inhibited rather than enhanced by schooling. It then facilitates the
engagement of young people with the real world around them so that they can con-
tinue to learn and prepare themselves for leadership. It is best when it recognizes that
it is the whole community, not just the home environment that young people must be
allowed to come into healthy contact with and learn from.

Fortunately, we have some good examples of this working very well. But first, lets
look at and evaluate how the schools are doing in several key areas to the future and
the community:

How well do the schools help to build the respect of children for their parents? How
well do the schools prepare young people for rebuilding / developing their commu-
nities? How well do the schools -even affluent schools - help their students under-
stand the broad social questions and challenges of the future? How well do schools
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help their students understand the social and economic contradictions that currently
face our nation and the world? How well do the schools prepare people for creative
thinking and problem solving "outside the box"? How well do schools prepare the
young to be empathetic as well as goal oriented? How well do schools prepare young
people to question prevailing wisdom and to challenge authority? How well do
schools teach practical survival skills needed for the concrete situations that our
young people find themselves in? This would include conflict avoidance , food pro-
curement, emergency shelter, accident avoidance, etc.

"If the object were to make pupils think, rather than to make them accept conclu-
sions, education would be conducted quite differently: there would be less rapidity of
instruction and more discussion, more occasions when pupils are encouraged to ex-
press themselves, more attempt to make education concern itself with matters in
which the pupils feel some interest." (Bertrand Russell, The Basic Writings of Ber-
trand Russell)

We might conclude from this that there are a number of beneficial things that schools
could teach our children, but these things are not even a part of the curriculum.

How do we encourage our young people to take up their leadership roles in the
community if they are not even encouraged to respect themselves, that community or
its other members?

Going at it from a different angle

It would be easy enough to assume that the problem with schools lies with teachers.
It could be inferred from the difficulties of students that the teachers are not doing a
good enough job. A mild variation on this theme is that there is not enough money
for them to do a good job. Either they are said to not be trained well enough, or to
have too many students, or too many administrative duties that take them away from
teaching or not enough equipment or not enough something.

If on the other hand we proceed from looking at parents, children, the community
and the future, we can ask ourselves is what the teachers are hired to do that which
really needs to be done? Don't we have a structural problem here rather than a prob-
lem with implementation? In fact, isn't the problem that the plan is wrong?

The idea that young people need to be brought into substantial and meaningful con-
tact with the adults who are engaged in the life of the community in such a way that
they can be inspired by them and learn from them is not at the heart of the mission of
the schools. Rather, schools seek to develop a "curriculum" which is intended as a
"one size fits all" stamp to imprint future behavior and knowledge on young people.

From the standpoint of the real interests of parents and most of the community for
the future and development of children, it isn't working. From the standpoint of the
continuity of the community structures and community life as we know it, it is
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working very well. That is because the schools do a stellar job of sorting out children
into "winners and losers" and helping them to understand that their station in life is
ultimately their fault.

The powers that be need more folks in fast food than in engineering, and that is what
we get. They need more in janitorial services than in medicine. They need more in
jail than in college, They need more in black market drug sales than in capital goods
manufacturing. And of course, these forces get what they need from their schools.
This is part of the source of the society's overall success as the most powerful coun-
try in the world.

For those who feel excluded from that power, there is a dilemma. Should they insist
on finding room inside the existing paradigm for their child, or should they "rock the
boat" and insist that the entire structure is not healthy in the long term and over all
sense?

More and more there are fundamental problems being raised with the direction of our
community into the future. Many parents who have these questions are not at all
clear how they should be resolved relative to their children. While general critiques
of the social structure can be made, what about Shuquesha's, Shanikwa's and Jardell's
future?

Ultimately, it will have to be Shuquesha, Shanekwa and Jardell who will decide that
future. There is no amount of coercion that will reliably force them into any one par-
ticular mold. The greatest hope for them to either engage in this society fully as it is,
or to come to understand the need to transform it, is engaging them into a non-
abstract process of social involvement rather than isolating them from the commu-
nity and spoon-feeding them "curriculum".
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Fourth of July Poem

Friday, June 27, 2003

I probably won't celebrate the 4th of
July this year.

I mean I won't really celebrate it.

I may go downtown and listen to
bands

Or maybe even play in one,

Or I might go to a fire works show

And listen to the children's "ooh"s and
"aah"s,

As they watch the skies light up

And hear the report from the cele-
brating cannons and mortars

Imitating war, while celebrating Pax
Americana.

But I won't celebrate the 4th of July

Because there is nothing there for me
to celebrate.

Most of my folks were slaves

When those fancy pieces of paper
were being signed

With even fancier handwriting,

Declaring that all men were created
equal --

Endowed, as it were, by their Al-
mighty Creator

With certain inalienable rights --

Rights to life, liberty, and the pursuit
of happiness.

But my folks were slaves.

They didn't mean us --

They couldn't have meant us.

They owned us like cattle.

They counted us like bales of cotton.

At most, two-thirds a man, by the
book,

And then only to see how many white
men

Would sit to represent the region

Where we had no rights,

To life or

To liberty

And the only happiness we could pur-
sue was

Dreaming about running away

And trying to find the rest of our fam-
ily

Who had been sold down the river.

I said most of my folks were slaves

'Cause some of my folks

Were slaveholders, seducers and rap-
ists.
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I don't much feel like celebrating them

Or what they were celebrating, either.

I don't claim them.

But they were there.

You can see them today

In the yellow skin of my brother and
sister.

You can hear them today

In our "family" name

And in the inflexions of our speech.

You can sense them today

In the stiffness of my walk,

In my introspection,

In my wariness,

And in my anger.

They haven't said "We are sorry."

They haven't said "We were wrong."

They haven't said "We owe you for
what you did."

They haven't said "We owe you for
what we did."

Their children go on acting like noth-
ing happened.

As though, through rape, we are not
all cousins now.

As though it was all only our fault.

As though we ought to be ashamed.

As though there is more shame in be-
ing forced to be a slave --

A sign of weakness

Than choosing to be a slave master --

A sign of immorality.

As though we ought to be grateful

For having been "civilized"

And for getting religion.

As though their god and the blessings
of their civilization

Could ever repay us

For the brutality,

For the indignity,

For the humiliation,

For the destitution,

For the despair,

And for the destruction

Of our gods and civilization

That they hoped we would forget

When they took away our drums.

Their children go on accepting their
privilege

Acting like we are begging for favors
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For special treatment,

For undeserved preference,

For sympathy --

Affirming through action, our inferi-
ority.

Their children spread that same arro-
gance around the world

With a made-up-myth about being
from a nation conceived in liberty

Conveniently leaving out the genocide
and the slavery,

Conveniently forgetting the "trail of
tears"

And the tears that trailed from the lash
and the chains.

They ask of their modern day victims:

"Why do they hate us".

Why wouldn't they "hate us" if they

Are not deluded by the phony legends

And see instead the devastation

Still wreaked by this haughty greed.

The white children of the slave hold-
ers and the seducers and the rapists

Along with their guests and friends

Will be celebrating the 4th of July.

They will celebrate a freedom that
many others of us still don't know.

They will celebrate their victories in
wars where we had nothing to win.

And in the civil war the only war that
did make a difference,

They celebrate the reconciliation and
not the victory.

They celebrate the deal that healed
their nation

While tearing the flesh and ripping
gaping, oozing wounds in my people.

While we're still waiting for our 40
acres and a mule.

I won't be celebrating the 4th of July
this year.

For me there is nothing to celebrate.
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Education and Community

March 9, 1999

These are some educational principles based on African traditional education that I
have found and updated to our context:

*       Education is not limited to school.
*       Children learn all the time.
*       Everyone is an educator. Children learn from all that they see and hear and

from everyone they are around.
*       Education should be linked to the reality of the environment.(Environmentally

conscious.)
*       Education should be linked to the reality of the community. (Socially con-

scious.)
*       Education should be linked to productive work. (Economically conscious.)
*       Education should foster sense of community identity and responsibility.
*       The whole community has a responsibility to be concerned about all the chil-

dren's education.
*       A good society is in balance.
*       Science and mathematics plays a key role.
*       Spiritual matters are important must be respected in all aspects of life.
*       Parents play a particularly important role in the education of their children.
*       Children should be taught to respect and appreciate their elders.
*       Culture should be respected and advanced.
*       Reading and writing are fundamental.

Long before there were schools, there were always processes by which young peo-
ple, in their transition from childhood to adulthood, came to know what was required
of them (their responsibilities) and came to be armed with the information and skills
to discharge those requirements. We can think of the educational process in its most
general terms, as the immersion in one's culture - real culture, not the static, some-
times mummified culture we put on display in museums and on stages, but the dy-
namic day to day culture of existence. Humans are not born knowing very much.
While young horses can stand and even run within hours of their birth, humans de-
velop much more slowly and are armed with far fewer instincts to help assure our
survival. We have to learn almost everything. We require long periods of adult guid-
ance, support and protection to acquire the necessary intellectual and physical tools
to be self sustaining and productive.

The educational process is necessarily intergenerational. That is, it involves one gen-
eration interacting with another and passing along its experiences and knowledge and
in a sense, its spirit, to another. There was a time when everyone was naturally in-
volved. To learn how to do something, you worked beside and took instructions from
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someone who did it. You learned how to sow and cultivate from someone who was
farming. You learned how to hunt from a hunter. You learned shoe making from a
shoemaker. You learned what it meant to be a member of the community from the
community members all around you.

The advent of schools as separate institutions took these intergenerational processes
out of the hands of the whole community and placed them in the hands of specialists
whose job was teaching school. The arena for education moved from the whole
community into the schoolhouse. This came about as society became more and more
specialized and fragmented. The social division of labor must have seemed to require
it. We can lament the fact that this took place but it remains a fact. It tends to explain
some of the social and economic problems that our society has. Those who would be
shoemakers are taught by those who have never made a shoe. We wonder why some
young people find it so difficult to fit into their communities in a healthy and whole-
some way when they are instructed in civics by those who hold their communities in
contempt, and who are not familiar with its realities. More and more, most adults feel
alienated from the process of the education of children. We have accepted too lim-
ited a role because we are not the experts, the educators, the teachers and the school
administrators. This leaves education barren and often abstract - disconnected from
life and community, and not serving the children well in their transition to adulthood.

It is easy to see why community control of education is so important. It helps to
minimize the distance that "schooling as a specialty" has created between the reali-
ties of our children's communities and the education that must prepare them for their
futures.

This is not to say that there are no good teachers. This is not to say that there are no
special skills required for teaching children. It is to say that what we are trying to do
with education inside the specialized institutions that are schools can and historically
has been taken care of inside the functioning community as a whole. Moreover, if we
want to increase the relevance of educational institutions, we need to reintegrate
adults who are not school specialists, but rather who specialize in other areas, back
into the process.

Before there were schools, the preparation for adulthood must have very naturally
included information about maturity, and the process of maturing. Rites of passage
for young men and young women existed under the supervision of the community.
Now days, there is an informal mix of activities that replaces these rites of passage. It
includes informal sex education talks on the street corners, activities and training in
church and Sunday school, summer camp, informal discussion in the home, with
parents, with siblings - all these things make up aspects of the education that young
people receive. Why, though, are we not satisfied with the small part of this overall
process that takes place in formal educational institutions? Because, for far too many
of our young people, the things that they get outside of school are insufficient, and
what they get inside school contradicts rather than adds to their overall preparation
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for productive involvement in society as adults. This includes an understanding of
their role in the society and responsibility to improve that society.

There is a certain curiosity and excitement about learning that is natural in young
people. Although humans don't seem to have many instincts, the drive to explore and
to learn and to understand seems to be "hard wired" and almost universal. Even for
babies, learning is its own reward. The tragedy is that send our children to schools
that can destroy this curiosity and natural love for knowledge and learning in our
young people by the time they are in the third or fourth grade.

Children in our society often end up isolated and divorced from the very things that
make up the world they live in. They have no knowledge of how most of the things
they use work. They have no idea where the things that they use and consume come
from. They have no idea who makes the decisions that determine the quality and
character of their lives. They have no idea who makes the things that they are sur-
rounded by. As a result, everything is hokus spokus. And a young person's ability to
decide what he wants to make of his life, or to put it in different terms, his ability to
decide where he should fit in this mysterious scheme of adult activity that actually
defines the world he lives in is near zero. All too often, all he can model himself after
are those adults who do enter into his world with whatever limited power and in-
volvement they have in it. Is it a wonder then that our young people often fall so far
short of their potential? They have no idea what they want to do because they have
so little exposure to people doing things and the inner workings of what is done.

Seldom are young people given the opportunity to be excited about anything. Many
youth have never been around adults who are excited about what they do. Certainly
this is true of far too many school classrooms. Who remembers an elementary math
or science teacher who seemed genuinely excited about the wonders of science and
consistency of mathematics? All too often these subjects are presented as discrete
facts to be memorized, rather than consistent systems to be discovered and under-
stood. One approaches such knowledge from the standpoint of failure: at best, your
grasp of other people's discoveries will be less than theirs, and you are not armed
with the tools or charged with the task of making discoveries of your own.

We need to establish a process to get adults who are enthusiastic about something to
share that excitement with some young people on a regular basis. In many ways, it
does not even matter what particular thing it is. Those adults who are really into gar-
dening should do some gardening with some youthful apprentices. Those who take
pictures should get some young people doing it with them. Those who sew, or bake
or build furniture or build model rocket or sing or design things, or whatever, should
make sure that the next generation knows about those things and the pleasure and
thrill that can come along with them.

A model curriculum for a school that wanted to make use of some of the principle s
outlined here would include classes along the following themes:
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*     How does it work? (Science and Math) -- use cell phones and pagers to teach
math and physics

*     Who makes it? (Careers) expose kids to manufacturing careers
*     How is it made? (Manufacturing technology)
*     Who decides it? (Civics) expose young people to the decision making processes

as they affect them
*     What happened and what difference did it make? (History, History of Science)
*     How did they feel? (Sociology, Psychology, History, Literature)
*     What did they do? (History)
*     How do things develop? (Philosophy, History, Science)
*     Where did it happen? (Geography, world history)
*     What is fair in this situation? (Law, Sociology, Civics, Philosophy)
*     How can I express myself and what is truly beautiful? (Writing, Art, Music)
*     How do I know what is true? (Philosophy, Science, History) Etc.

We need to be able to answer questions that young people ask us about the world and
about what they are learning.  Schooling does not always need to be abstract. How
many young math students shut down in geometry class when they don't get a seri-
ous answer to "Why would anyone want to know this?" We should have a good an-
swer that question or get the material out of the syllabus.
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Speech Delivered at the 30th Anniversary Commemoration of
the 1969 Takeover of Cornell University Willard Straight Hall

April 19, 1999

It is with a great deal of humility that I am here today. I would like to thank all the
groups and individuals who were responsible for inviting me. This is important to
me. Much of my life has been defined by these events we are here to day to com-
memorate.

With a great deal of humility, I would like to thank a lot of people who can not be
here today: John Garner, Robert Rone and Larry Dickson. These three brothers were
leaders in the Afro-American Society in 1969 and an inspiration to many of us here.
While they have all passed away, they will not be forgotten.

There are others who cannot be here today who never came to Cornell, but who are a
part of what our struggle here has been about. I include Mumia Abu Jamaal, Amadou
Diallo, Kwame Cannon and others unjustly imprisoned or murdered by this repres-
sive and racist system. (Kwame Cannon is the 30 year old son of Willena Cannon
who was a member of the organization that was masacred by the Ku Klux Klan in
Greensboro, NC in November of 1979. His mother and others successfully sued the
City of Greensboro and the Police Department for their complicity in the wrongful
death of their associate s. Since the court system could not get to Willena Cannon,
they got to her son. This young Black man was sentenced to 3 life sentences for a
series of non-violent burglaries he committed while he was 17 years old crimes that
would have gotten others a slap on the wrist. These crimes had been committed
while his mother was "black-listed" for her political activity and could not find ade-
quate work to buy him some of the things he wanted. It took about five years of con-
sistent struggle led by Black ministers and community activists that drew in the
Mayor of Greensboro, a sitting US congressman, a former State Supreme Court
Chief Justice, and thousands of ordinary citizens writing letters and asking the gov-
ernor to commute this outlandish sentence. After 13 years in prison, Kwame Cannon
was finally released March 31 of this year.)

My remarks tonight are necessarily narrow. I don't know very much. None of us do.
When what we know is held up against all the knowledge that is known, our knowl-
edge is very small indeed. So much new mathematics is written and published each
month, for instance, that it would be impossible for any single individual to keep up
with it all. The same is true for other disciplines. No one knows very much. Who
here can speak Urdu? What about Amharic? Who knows the funerary rituals of the
mountain people of the Cameroon? If you lived there it would be very important for
you to know. So both for the depth of it, and for the breadth of it, none of us know
very much of all that is known. Knowing a lot, then cannot be what it means to be
educated.
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So much is known, yet we can only know so much.

We need to have an understanding then, of what things we should know. What con-
stitutes the knowledge of an educated person? What we need to understand very well
is our community, our neighborhood, our place in the world. We need to know our
particular environment. We really need to understand in some depth how we fit into
the world and how to deal with what is around us. We need to engage our environ-
ment, and survive in it if we are to ever move on to transform it, or transcend it, or
even transfer out of it. The first thing we have to know is how to survive in it.

We also need to understand that this dynamic, interactive and responsive "soup" that
is the environment in which we find ourselves, is self-replicating. Every day, every
year within the limits of the mutations that take place, it reproduces itself and every-
thing that is in it. If we got rid of every criminal in the country today, and did noth-
ing else, we would produce more tomorrow. If every drug addict suddenly dropped
dead, we would create new ones to take their place. We are constantly engaged in
reproducing out of this "soup" every thing that is in it. And we know much too little
of the process of that reproduction. We don't understand much at all of the "social
DNA" that contains the essential elements of "genetic code" for this self replication
that takes place without our conscious intervention and sometimes even without our
knowledge. We don't know very much. And there is so much we need to know.

I say that to lead us back to what we were struggling for here at Cornell in 1969. We
wanted a relevant education. We wanted to understand the communities that we had
come from well enough to be able to creatively engage them and in engaging them to
transform them and transcend them. We understood that even if we wanted to build
bridges out of those communities, bridges across lines of class, of race and of gender
understanding, the bridges had to have foundations that were strong and deeply an-
chored in the community or else they would collapse when others tried to follow us
on the way out.

If our education at Cornell was to have any real meaning, any real relevance, any real
significance, it needed to be an education that was rooted in its connection to our
communities and the struggle of the people there to survive, to transform and to tran-
scend those communities.

I said that my remarks were narrow because I am talking mainly about African
American students and the African American Community. While I recognize that
some of what I say will be applicable and adaptable other people and situations, I
want to say that I think it is alright to be specific and to be concrete.

Why is it that we are here tonight narrowly talking about the understanding of one
group of people when in fact, we live in a global village? Air travel, the Internet, and
satellite communication have all shortened the time and in effect, the distance be-
tween people. But even in a global village, it is OK to develop your own hut. No one
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else will develop your hut for you. No one else should develop your hut for you.
And, in fact, no one else can develop your hut for you. You are responsible for de-
veloping your own hut, yourself. If you don't do it, it doesn't get done. If it is not
done, it is not only we who live in the hut who are hurt, but along with us, the entire
global village is diminished because we have brought nothing to contribute to it.

Being invited to visit other huts is fine. Being offered a chance to admire and gain
from the development of other huts is fine, but we mustn't always go into other huts
empty handed because we haven't been productive in developing the resources in our
hut. We need to develop our hut to be able to bring something with us when we go
into the other huts, or the entire global village suffers.

As an aside, I am involved a lot with public school education issues. My friends in
the NAACP always rush to point out that separate schools are inherently unequal
every time some of us raise the need to maintain and control some educational insti-
tutions in our community. It is good that they have memorized this phrase from the
historic 1954 Brown v. Board case, but it doesn't really tell us very much. From the
way they use the term "segregated" to mean any place there are not enough white
people, most of us could be said to be from "segregated" families. Are separate
families inherently unequal? Many of us attend churches in our community that are
overwhelmingly black or even all black. Would anyone want to argue that these
churches are segregated and as separate institutions inherently unequal? Even if you
look at the question of resources, Black churches and families obviously don't have
as many material resources as white churches and families. Does that even make
them inherently unequal? Do these institutions promote separatism and prevent the
people who are a part of them from ever going out into the world and interacting
with others on an equal footing? Obviously not. That cannot be what it means that
"separate is inherently unequal." But I still don't understand what these assimilation-
ists do actually mean with their talk about the inherent inequity of institutions we
build.

So, in spite of what some people say, I still say, we have to develop our hut. That
does not mean that we hate the other people in the other huts. But, we have to de-
velop our hut. That does not mean that we will never have anything to do with the
other people and the things they do in their huts. It doesn't mean that we cannot or
should not learn from other huts. What it does mean is that if we are to have a truly
global village where we all contribute on the basis of equality, we have to develop
our hut ourselves.

Much is said when discussing the public schools about the achievement gap in public
education. What some people don't understand is that the gap gets wider as the years
of public school attendance increase. If all those early intervention advocates were
right, and if the problem stemmed from all the things the children didn't get in those
years before they started school, then going to school should narrow the gap rather
than allow it to widen. No, the problem is not what the children did not learn before
they entered school, the problem is with the "relevance gap", where every year what
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is taught in school is further and further away from what young people see in their
communities and need to be able to understand. What they are taught everyday is
further and further away from what they sense that they need to survive and to trans-
form and transcend their communities. Young people, even babies have a natural cu-
riosity, a natural desire to explore and question and learn everything they can. The
public schools have found a way to strip that curiosity and craving for knowledge
from school children by the time they are in the third or fourth grade. This is from
the "relevance gap" widening. If we can see that gap widening in the public schools,
think of how wide it is by the time we reach the university level.

That is what we were dealing with here at Cornell 30 years ago. We looked around
us at the country and the communities we were from. There was the war in Vietnam.
There were the hundred cities that had urban rebellions after the assassination of Dr.
Martin Luther King. There were the Black students at South Carolina State Unive r-
sity in Orangeburg, SC that had been shot and killed the year before while trying to
integrate a bowling alley. There were the hundreds of communities that we had come
from where unemployment was too high, where underemployment was the rule,
where education was inadequate where housing was substandard and where the
quality of life of our people was not what it needed to be. We wanted an education
that spoke to that reality. We wanted to be better equipped to survive that reality and
also to understand that reality well enough to transform it and transcend it and help
others build bridges out of it. That was what a relevant education was to many of us.

We didn't really understand or appreciate Cornell's reluctance to help us develop
such a program of study. Ezra Cornell had said "I would build an institution where
any person can gain instruction in any subject." So the questions that kept being
raised about the "academic legitimacy" of Black Studies were answered as far as we
were concerned. Perhaps, there was a hidden view that the only thing that had "aca-
demic legitimacy" was the maintenance of the status quo. We did not appreciate why
a group of people who had had many years to construct relevant educational pro-
grams for us, but who had not done so, were suddenly so concerned that they would
tell us what we "really" wanted and place limits on what we could get. There were
many meetings, and many discussions and supplications before the many protests
that took place over the winter and spring of 1968 and 1969.

By the time we reach the University, we have done a lot of surviving. Whether by
our wits, or by our good fortune, by the time we reach the University, we have made
it a lot further than many of our brothers and sisters ever make it.

Those who don't make it end up making up the prison population, the prostitutes, the
drug addicts and dealers, the street gangs. Some others of us go too early to populate
the cemeteries where the dreams and the potential of too many of our young people
are buried along with their broken bodies. It was for those who were left behind, who
did not survive, that we fought for the type of independent Black Studies that could
speak to the environment we were from, to the real conditions in our communities
and help to inform us so we could help to lead the struggle for a better life. It was in
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memory of some, in honor of others and as the only remaining hope of others yet,
that we needed our presence at Cornell to be connected to our community's survival,
transformation and prosperity.

Recently, I wrote a children's story "On the Mountaintop Preparation for Living
Down in the Valley." The sense of part of the story was " It's OK for a few of you
can come up here, if you don't bring those "valley ways" up here with you." But the
other problem was that learning on the mountaintop does not prepare you adequately
for surviving down in the valley with the "valley beasts" and the "valley sinking
pits". The learning on the mountaintop will not teach you how to grow the special
fruit that only grows in the valley. Learning mountain talk and the silly looking
mountain walk, won't help you communicate and get around in the valley. When we
take the children from the valley, and teach them only about the mountaintop, we
prepare them only for failure.

At some point, I would like for us to have time to talk about what constitutes a good
education, both as it relates to the public schools and as it relates to the University.
Our view 30 years ago was that we had a right to that good education, and that we
were determined to make this university live up to the words of Ezra Cornell.

There are many questions that remain to be answered. There are questions of com-
munity development and of economic development as it affects our community.
There are problems with police repression and injustices in the criminal justice sys-
tem. There are problems with the public schools that are now crippling more of our
children than they are educating. There are many needs that are not adequately being
met. There is still far too much suffering. There is too much despair. The struggle for
a relevant education has to be coupled with an ongoing struggle to keep it real and
keep it connected to the community. We continue to have a need for a relevant edu-
cation to help us get some things straight in our hut.

Again, I say to you very humbly, there is so much we need to know. There are so
many people who need us.

Thank you for your attention.
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We Who God has Blessed with Locks

June 24, 2002

Coming home from buying some books and music, I saw a man standing at an inter-
section with a sign. It read:
*   I’m on the road,
*   I’m broke,
*   I’m hungry,
*   Please help me.
*   God bless you.

By the agility with which he moved from one place to another, making the best ad-
vantage of sign placement regarding traffic flow, he did not seem to particularly need
help. I remembered the stories of people who had found that “Will Work For Food”
signs got them more money than either food or work and sometimes much more
money than many of us who are working. It gets easier and easier to dismiss beggars,
panhandlers or whatever we may call them:  They don’t want to work. They think
someone owes them something. Why should those of us who work take from out la-
bors to pay them to stand there and beg?”

I thought again about his sign. Maybe I had misread it. Perhaps it had said, “…Please
help me – God has blessed you.” Perhaps what he really meant was “Look, some of
you are benefiting every day from this messed up system that isn’t helping me right
now at all. God has blessed you to have some things that you need to share.”

If that doesn’t make any sense to you, then consider this: Not one drop of the water
that is being sold daily was either designed not made by any of the people or groups
who sell it. The basic design of the fruit, the live-stock animals, the vegetables were
all here and for free. No one made a square inch of the land that farmers and ranchers
use or that the factories are built on. No one put a drop of oil or a pound of coal or
uranium into the ground.

We did build some fences, though. We made some doors where we could lock up the
food and provide it conditionally through sale or special favors. We built more
fences and staked claims to pieces of land, protecting them with guns and explosives.
We kept other folks locked out of what we claimed to be ours and “developed” it for
our own benefit. Some of us have benefited from these locks. God has blessed us.
Others have not benefited. This guy was only asking that those who have benefited –
who God has blessed – help him out since he was having a hard time and since he
has a right to a part of the bounty too.

Maybe his request isn’t nearly as unreasonable as many would think it to be.
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On the Concentration of Students with Low Socio-Economic
Status in Neighborhood Schools

A Liberation Perspective

 3/25/99

Perhaps the best argument to be made against neighborhood schools is that neigh-
borhood schools will lead to a concentration of students with low SES (Socio-
Economic-Status) in some schools. It is then said that this would cause a downward
spiral of negative peer pressure, low expectations, and poor performance. This, it is
suggested, should be remedied by establishing and maintaining school diversity
goals that will prevent such concentrations with all the unhealthy effect that these
concentrations would have on the culture of a school. Through this argument, the
"it's not just race" position is made alongside the position stemming from the Brown
decision that "separate schools are inherently unequal".

Two things need to be looked at. First, what is the experience of these same low SES
students when they are disbursed throughout the school system by some process of
racial and/or SES balance, and second, what would be the most appropriate setting
and treatment of these children.

I would contend that when low SES students are distributed throughout the schools,
there in no substantially better outcome for them as individuals. That is to say, if we
concentrate the data on the children, rather than concentrate the children, we would
see the same grim results that can be observed if the children are placed together.
The difference, which is somehow more socially tolerable, is that we can hide this
performance and these children better if they are spread around. These are the chil-
dren who, even in a mixed setting, have the highest dropout rates, the highest sus-
pension rates, the highest retention rates, the lowest grades, the worst attitudes about
school, about society, about each other and about themselves. When they are spread
out, there is just a little of this negativity in a lot of places and it becomes a self-
curing problem because many of these children drop out of school as soon as they
can and the statistics of the institutions they leave improve. While there may be some
positive peer pressure from being around middle and upper class children, there is
also an effect of feeling different and isolated, and needing to act out in order to gain
any attention and assert one's individuality. Much of the latter will offset the former.
We need to be honest with ourselves about the fact that by and large we are com-
pounding and hiding the problem.

The character of the educational activity that goes on when this group of low SES
children are concentrated in a school by virtue of the fact that they live in communi-
ties that might be served by the same school should also be examined. Often, the cur-
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riculum does not properly match the needs of the children in the context of their
community. If we are trying to force-feed children information that does not matter
to them, then it is no wonder that they reject it rather than engage it fully. We need to
do more work in developing the curriculum that integrates a concern for education
with a concern for social justice. Such a curriculum would address the reality of race
and economics by looking at discrimination and poverty. Such a curriculum should
be real to the students who study it, because it should address the questions:

* Who am I?

* Why is my community like it is?

* What is possible for me?

* What is possible for my community?

* How can I change things for myself as an individual?

* How can I change things for my community?

If this is not the basic characteristic of what we are teaching these children, we need
to ask ourselves why should they be interested in it. If this is what we are teaching,
then what would be the problem with the concentration of children for whom these
questions are relevant? Would it not be possible in relatively small and intense set-
tings to generate the type of discussion around these things that get into the depths of
philosophic, historical, literary, scientific, aesthetic and moral questions that form the
core of a solid education? I think so. When our low SES students are so engaged and
on this basis prepare themselves to engage in their own and their community's lib-
eration and advancement, then they will be good subjects for engaging with others as
equals. As this happens we will have some real dialogue and understanding about
race, economics and justice.

The obvious question is: Can we reasonably expect that this is the type of education
that our children will receive if they are in neighborhood schools organized by the
school system? The sad answer is, probably not. Those of us who care need to de-
velop a clearer notion of what our children need to be learning based on the notion
that education should enable a child to deal with his environment. Dealing with your
environment means both learning to survive within it, and also learning how to im-
prove it, or better yet, transform it and in our case, liberate it. What we have in the
current curriculum for low SES students whether they are concentrated or spread out
is a block of subject matter that ignores their real environment and by extension, it
avoids them. This again is a source of alienation that much of the discussion of
school reform does not even attempt to address.

The "more money" strategies to fund early intervention, and other "gap closing" pro-
grams are limited to dealing with individual students without addressing the question
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of the relations of those students to their communities. These strategies could only
work if the children pretend that their reality is not real and simply try to escape.
Some individuals have, and others will continue to be able to do just that, but that
fact should not cause us to develop an educational strategy that requires such an ab-
normal and rare act. After learning the capital of Vermont, talking about Woodrow
Wilson and practicing calculating ratios and proportions, the children still go home
to their impoverished lives in their sub-standard homes and watch the black-market
drug economy provide most of the employment in their neighborhood. It is no won-
der that the educational gap grows wider as our young people mature. What we teach
them and what they see grow wider and wider apart.

We need to establish schools with a Liberation Agenda.

We need to train teachers to go into existing institutions as subversives to overthrow
the irrelevant processes and develop relevant ones. We need to support those teach-
ers as they come in conflict with the school administrators. We need to embrace our
children and show them a hope that grows from their circumstances rather than sim-
ply ignoring them. We need our community and concerned citizens to come together
to develop the resources to make this happen. It will be a big task, but the results will
be well worth it.
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Childhood Clarity and anti-Semitism

3/14/2003

Being born in 1949 and raised in Little Rock, Arkansas, I know more about prejudice
than I ever wanted to know. I remember, as a child, thinking how much easier it
would be to be a white racist who could simply hate all black people than it was to
be a young black person interested in progress and having to evaluate white folks
individually, on the basis of their merit. That difference brings me to some thoughts
on some literature being distributed recently here in Greensboro and most likely
other places. On the surface the literature seems to oppose the war in Iraq - some-
thing very dear to me, but in doing so raises up some very vicious anti-Semitism --
something for which I have no tolerance.

The flyer, put out in a few white Greensboro neighborhoods by a group of neo-Nazis
calling themselves "The Creativity Movement", argues that the pending war with
Iraq is Israel's war and that it should be left to the "cowardly Jews" who want us to
be their "cannon fodder".

The flyer is not a reasoned critique of why a US attack on Iraq would be wrong nor
is it even a criticism or serious analysis of the situation in Israel and the Palestinian
territories. It is a broadside attack on Jews. It is that thing that even as a child I
thought was easy and wrong.

The problem with anti-Semitism is that like all other forms of racism, it doesn't make
any sense. It lumps things together that should be separate and it separates things and
people that should be together. It puts together Ariel Sharon and Benjamin
Netanyahu, on the one hand, for all their real and planned crimes against the Pales-
tinian people with no less Jewish people like long time Israeli peace advocate Uri
Avnery and my friend from Hillsboro, Andy Silver. Andy is an Israeli citizen who
left Israel in the mid 80s out of conscience and recently organized nationally the
"Jews for Cynthia McKinney" to raise money for her congressional campaign and
who is an active and outspoken advocate for peace and justice and the rights of the
Palestinian people. Anti-Semitism lumps together the virulently racist American
Jewish organization , The Anti-Defamation League (ADL) which has engaged in at-
tacks on African American leadership as well as opposition within Jewish circles and
in Israel itself to its blind support for Israeli policy on the one hand with groups like
Gush Shalom, "the hard core of the Israeli peace movement" and B'Tselem "The Is-
raeli Information Center for Human Rights in the Occupied Territories". These are
organizations that are very critical of current Israeli policy, oppose and expose hu-
man rights abuses and which oppose the occupation of the Palestinian territories.

Jewish people like people of all other groups come in all shapes sizes orientations,
ideologies and attitudes. Certainly not all of my Jewish friends agree with my posi-
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tion on the importance of ending the occupation of Palestinian territories and some
who don't know me very well have even accused me of being anti-Semitic for having
an opinion on the issue at all. I have no problem feeling that we as Americans have a
responsibility to oppose our government's injustices and its support for the injustice
perpetrate d by other governments. The $5Billion or so that currently goes to support
Israel's current policy is something that we in the USA need to be talking to our rep-
resentatives in Washington about. But this trash from "The Creativity Movement" is
something else all together. It is not about Israel or Israeli policy. It is not about Iraq
or US policy there. It is a filthy piece spewing hatred for Jews.

While I was born black in the south, I will stand with people anywhere in the world
against oppression and feel at one with them. I have been a South African opposing
apartheid. I will tell you now that I am a Palestinian in the occupied territories, I am
an Iraqi, anxious about US war plans, I am an Afghan longing for peace and an end
to foreign entanglements, and today, with this literature being distributed here in
Greensboro, I am a Greensboro Jew. Like war, racism, colonial occupations and em-
pire building, anti-Semitism is wrong and I knew it, even as a child.
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Black Understanding of the US Lynch Mob
November 8, 2001

There  i s  something  in  the  menta l i ty  of  b lack  fo lks  in  the  USA tha t  i s  connected  to  our
his tory in  these lands.  I t  i s  the  memory burned into  our  col lect ive consciousness  of  the
te r ror  o f  lynch  mobs ,  race  r io t s ,  and  mob v io lence .  We remember  Tulsa ,  Oklahoma;
Rosewood,  Flor ida;  At lanta ,  Georgia  1906;  Chicago,  I l l inois  1919;  Ela ine ,  Arkansas
and too many other  t imes  and places  to  l i s t .

As  I  wr i te  these  l ines ,  the  bes t  a rmed and most  sophis t ica ted  lynch mob  in his t ory is
br inging panic ,  death  and des t ruct ion to  innocent  people  in  Afghanis tan .  I t  i s  a  lynch
mob organized ,  equipped and backed by  the  most  powerfu l  k i l l ing  machinery  in  the
world .  Some par ts  of  i t s  work are  be ing carr ied  out  f rom the  sani tary  heights  of  near ly
ten  mi les  up  as  B-52 ' s  conduct  the i r  carpe t  bombing of  the  Afghan c i t ies  and  count r y-
s ide .  Other  par t s  a re  conducted  a t  c loser  range  wi th  AC130 gunships  f ly ing  s low,  low
and  loud  wi th  h igh-speed ,  h igh-power  machine  guns  and  cannons  tha t  a re  des igned  as
much to  in t imidate  and cause  panic  as  to  tear  apar t  whatever  ta rge ts  they  are  a imed a t .
Then the  Specia l  Forces  move in  quickly  and s tea l th i ly  on  the  ground.  They are  hea v-
i ly  a rmed and t ra ined  to  k i l l  everyone  they  see  - -  men,  women and chi ldren  - -  to  gua r -
antee the success of  their  operat ions.

The target  is  Osama b in  Laden  and  h is  o rganiza t ion  Al  Qaeda ,  (" the  base")  a long wi th
the  Afghan Tal iban government  tha t  has  been " indic ted"  for  harbor ing these  ter ror is ts
and  suppor t ing  the i r  ac t iv i t ies .  No publ ic  ev idence  has  even  been  sugges ted  tha t
would point  to  the gui l t  of  the peoples  of  Afghanis tan in  any of  the a t roci t ies  that  took
place September  11.  I t  i s  the  people  of  Afghanis tan who must  wi thstand the  brunt  of
th is  a t tack .  The  publ ic  ev idence  even  aga ins t  Osama  b in  Laden  and  Al  Qaeda has
been  h ighly  c i rcumstan t ia l .  US government  spokespeople  have  sa id  tha t  they  have  in -
depth  and  convinc ing  evidence ,  but  tha t  i t  must  remain  secre t  to  pro tec t  US in te l l i -
gence  ga ther ing  methods .  Such  an  idea  se t s  a  dangerous  precedent  indeed .  The  exac t
same a rgument  can  be  made  wi th  no  modi f ica t ion  about  the  ev idence  ga thered  fo r  any
cr iminal  proceeding.  The poss ib i l i ty  of  exposing cr iminal  inves t iga t ion  techniques  i s
a lways  there .  As  the  draconian  PATRIOT ac t  cont inues  to  unfo ld  in  prac t ice ,  we
should look out  for  addi t ional  a t tacks on our  hard won civi l  l iber t ies .

But ,  in  any case ,  the  ques t ion  of  ev idence  i s  a lways  secondary  to  a  lynch  mob. Its
real  purpose is  not  to bring the guil ty part ies  to just ice,  but  rather  to put  whole pop u-
la t ions  in  thei r  p lace  through violence ,  fear  and in t imidat ion whi le  advancing other ,
more  fundamenta l ,  agendas .  The  mob 's  log ic  i s  s imple :  Someone ' s  gu i l t  i s  dec lared .
The lack of  need of  any judic ia l  procedure  is  asser ted.  Then the  cal l  i s  made for  a
summary execut ion.  "We know he did  i t .  Ain ' t  no  need wast ing no t ime on no t r ia l .
Let ' s  s t r ing  ' em  up!"  This  a l lows the  mob ac t ion  to  go  forward  wi thout  the  comple x-
i ty  o f  hav ing  to  s top ,  th ink  and  examine  any  fac t s .  We b lack  fo lks  know about  tha t
process .  That  would have to  explain par t  of  why there  is  a  difference in  the level  of
suppor t  between black and whi te  US res idents  for  Bush 's  mi l i tary  pol ic ies  in  the  a f-
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t e rmath  of  September  11 .  We know what  i t  fee ls  l ike  to  be  s i t t ing  ins ide ,  knowing tha t
a l l  tha t  i s  go ing  on  outs ide  i s  madness  and  tha t  a t  any  moment ,  the  madness  can  come
to  the  door  wi th  the  demand to  g ive  up  one  of  our  loved ones  to  sa t i s fy  some vig i-
lante 's  bloodlust .

I  remember  i t  f rom Li t t le  Rock,  Arkansas ,  where  I  was  an  8-year-old  chi ld  in  Se p -
tember  of  1957.  White  lynch mobs there  took to  the  s t reets  to  prevent  the  integrat ion
of  a  publ ic  h igh school ,  which I  ended up graduat ing  f rom ten  years  la ter .  I  was  only  8
at  the  t ime,  so  I  don ' t  remember  the  deta i ls  except  f rom reading i t  in  his tor ies ,  but  I
s t i l l  remember  the  fear .

The  Afghan  fami l ies  who are  watch ing  the i r  homes  des t royed ,  the i r  communi t ies  le v-
e led  and thei r  chi ldren torn  apar t  by  bombs,  c lus ter  bombs,  ar t i l le ry  and land mines
know,  too ,  wha t  I  am ta lk ing  about .   S o m e  have  a t tempted  to  f lee .  Others  have  had  to
calcula te  i f  they had enough food and water  or  a  re l iable  means  of  t ranspor ta t ion,  or
heal th  and energy enough to  walk  the  d is tance  to  the  border .  Others  have  rea l ized  or
found the  borders  to  be  c losed - -  the  only opt ion found to  be no opt ion a t  a l l .  And,  so ,
wi th  everyth ing d is rupted ,  people  who are  not  d i rec t ly  h i t  by  the  bombs are  beginning
to  d ie  o f  s ta rva t ion  and  d i sease .  These  Afghans  mus t  have  to  ask  themselves :  "Why
are  they  bombing  us?  Why a re  they  maiming  our  ch i ld ren?  Why are  they  k i l l ing  our
re la t ives?  We know no th ing  o f  New York .  We know no th ing  o f  Wash ing ton  DC.  We
have never  been on an  a i rp lane .  We don ' t  control  Al  Qaeda .  We  don ' t  know excep t
f rom your  news  b in  Laden .  We are  pa ined  enough by  the  ac t ions  of  our  own gover n -
ment .  We must  t ry  to  modera te  them."  But ,  the  v ig i lante  mob vio lence  goes  on .
Here  in  the  US,  the  media  t rot  out  a  dai ly  news die t  of  the  inhumani ty  of  the  Tal iban.
Some of  what  i s  shown must  cer ta in ly  be  accura te .  This  band of  re l ig ious  ext remis ts
have control  over  the  country  and ru le  wi th  the  harsh  hand of  ancient  t r iba l  law.  Pro s -
t i tu tes  a re  executed  in  publ ic  a renas  a t  the  same t ime th ieves  a re  hung f rom the  goa l
pos ts .  Women are  beaten  on the  s t ree t  for  not  wear ing vei l s  or  wear ing the  wrong
color  shoes  or  high heels .  They have banned the Internet .  Free speech is  severely l i m -
i ted.  Freedom of  re l ig ion is  unheard of .  The educat ion of  women is  out lawed.  This  i s
not  a  "n ice"  regime.  We need to  remember  a t  the  same t ime,  tha t  i f  the  US were
judged so le ly  by  what  i s  wrong or  ex t reme wi th in  i t s  borders  a  somewhat  d is tor ted
but  profoundly  d is turbing view of  i t  could  be  por t rayed.

As  one  of  the  few count r ies  in  the  wor ld  tha t  a l lows the  execut ion  of  ch i ldren ,  as  the
place  where  pol ice  of f icers  shoot  and  k i l l  unarmed people  who are  only  accused  of
t raf f ic  v io la t ions ;  as  the  p lace  where  an  unarmed immigrant  s t ree t  vendor  i s  shot  a t  41
t imes and hi t  19 whi le  reaching for  his  wal le t ;  as  the  place where  mental ly  i l l  people
are  shot  and ki l led  on the  s t ree t  when they need ass is tance;  as  the  p lace  where  poor
people  are  turned out  in to  the  cold  i f  they don ' t  have  the  proper  credent ia ls  for  eme r -
gency night  shel ters ;  as  the  p lace  where  chi ldren are  forced in to  educat ional  ins t i t u-
t ions  tha t  a re  so  mean and so  f rus t ra t ing  for  some of  them that  they turn  to  k i l l ing
their  c lassmates  before  taking their  own l ives ,  we could paint  a  t rue  pic ture  of  the
USA tha t  looks  as  bad  as  what  we  see  of  the  Ta l iban .  Looks  can  be  dece iv ing .  No
br ief  descr ip t ion  of  any government  or  cu l ture  can  capture  the  r ichness  and comple x-
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i ty  of  what  is  there .  These things  must  ul t imately  be  judged and corrected by the  pe o-
ple  themselves .  But  th is  approach to  the  Tal iban  i s  usefu l  in  making them seem so
evi l  that  whatever  v iolence the  US does  to  them is  jus t i f ied  whi le  the  real ,  unspoken
agenda  i s  advanced  and  we  the  peop le  o f  the  US a re  smugly  assured  o f  our  own r igh t-
eousness .

We have  a  need  to  unders tand  and  expose  th i s  rea l  agenda  beh ind  the  mob  or we are
compl ic i t  in  i t .  We need to  know i f  i t  i s  indeed the  case  tha t  the  p lans  for  an  invas ion
of  Afghanis tan  were  prepared wel l  before  September  11,  2001.   We need to  unde r-
s tand ful ly  the  connect ions  to  US oi l  companies '  need  for  an oi l  p ipel ine  across  A f -
ghanis tan  br inging  newly  found o i l  f rom the   Caspian  Sea .  This  p ipe l ine  would  only
be  v iable  i f  the  US has  cont ro l  of  a  "s tab le"  government  there .  We need  to  unders tand
how our  whole  involvement  in  the  Middle  Eas t  i s  connec ted  to  our  pa t te rns  of  energy
consumpt ion  and  connec ted  to  advancing  the  bus iness  in te res t s  tha t  p rof i t  f rom our
use  of  oi l .  We also need to  know the long term impact  of  our  pol ic ies  on the  l ives  and
l ivel ihood of  other  people  and the new pol i t ical  real i t ies  that  f low from people 's  r e -
s i s tance  to  dominat ion  and explo i ta t ion .  Jus t  as  the  Tulsa  a t tacks  in  1921 were  rea l ly
not  about  a  b lack  e leva tor  opera tor  assau l t ing  a  whi te  woman in  a  depar tment  s tore ,
but  were  more  an  ef for t  to  s top  the  growing commerc ia l  success  of  Tulsa ' s  a f f luent
black popula t ion ,  we need to  know what  i s  rea l ly  a t  s take  in  Afghanis tan  and I raq  and
S o malia  - -  countr ies  on Bush 's  short  l is t  of  places  to  a t tack while  f ight ing terror ism.

Since  there  i s  so  much in tu i t ive  unders tanding in  the  b lack  communi ty ,  we have  to
ask  where  are  our  so-ca l led  leaders?  Where  are  the  voices  saying ,  l ike  Malcolm sa id
in  the  ear ly  60s ,  that  you can ' t  unders tand what ' s  going on in  the  Congo unless  you
unders tand what ' s  going on in  Miss iss ippi  and that  you can ' t  unders tand what ' s  going
on in  Miss iss ippi  unless  you unders tand what ' s  going on in  the  Congo? When wi l l
they te l l  us  that  you can ' t  unders tand what ' s  going on in  Cincinnat i  and New York
unless  you unders tand  what ' s  going  on  in  Afghanis tan ,  and  tha t  you can ' t  unders tand
what ' s  going on in  Afghanis tan  unless  you unders tand what ' s  going on in  Cincinnat i
and New York? Do they rea l ly  th ink we need to  t ry  to  prove our  pat r io t i sm by e n -
dors ing  the  mob? Don ' t  they  know tha t  we represent  the  h ighes t  of  what  i s  bes t  about
the  USA when we ques t ion  and chal lenge ,  as  we a lways  have ,  the  pol ic ies  and  pra c -
t ices  tha t  a re  accepted  by  o thers?  In  some ways  we have  to  lead  the  s t ruggle  for  m o -
ral i ty ,  decency and democracy in  the  US.  But  that  is  not  a  role  that  is  foreign to  us .

In  the  mean t ime,  the  lynch  mob goes  on  and  o ther  Amer icans  wi th  the  mob menta l i ty
s tay  wrapped  comfor tab ly  in  the  f l ag ,  no t  th ink ing  and  somet imes  no t  concerned
about  the  t ruth  of  what  is  happening.  As that  cont inues ,  blacks a t  the  grassroots  level
wi l l  keep on drawing on our  h is tory  and drawing on the  unders tanding that  grows out
of  our  current  real i ty .  We have to  speak out ,  t ry  to  ask the  r ight  quest ions  and in  doing
so help  bui ld  the  movement  that  wi l l  lead th is  nat ion toward correct ing the  in jus t ices
i t  imposes on us and on the rest  of  the world.
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A Response to the Opponents of Neighborhood Schools

1998

Opponents of Neighborhood Schools say: People have fought and died for integra-
tion. So how can you support neighborhood schools that would be segregated?

Supporters of Neighborhood Schools respond: Some of the same people who were
involved in the struggle for integration support neighborhood schools because they
see that this does not mean opposing all integration. You cannot equate school bus-
sing for racial balance with integration. They are not the same. No one fought and
died for bussing. We need neighborhood schools because "there are some things that
our children need that they are not getting now." (These are the words of an 86 year
old former teacher of 37 years who fought for integration and saw both segregated
schools and schools after bussing and racial balance.) We need schools in our com-
munity that we control so we can make sure our children do get what they need. You
do not need white children sitting next to you to learn, but you do need an empow-
ered, involved community.

Opponents of Neighborhood Schools say: We have to have racial balance in schools
because diversity is important since we live in a diverse world.

Supporters of Neighborhood Schools respond: Yes, we live in a diverse world, and
we will continue to do so, but the best preparation for being involved and productive
in that diverse world is to approach it with self confidence and the necessary tools
and skills to succeed. We have a better opportunity to help instill that in the majority
of our young people in neighborhood schools. Then they will be able to function
anywhere in the world with anyone they come in contact with. What we have done
instead with bussing is let the school system continue to cripple, stigmatize, and
criminalize many of our young people so that the public school is the last diverse
setting they function in. It is more important to prepare young people to function in
an integrated society than it is to force them to integrate the schools and so damage
them that they have a hard time functioning anywhere.

Opponents of Neighborhood Schools say: Neighborhood schools would be second
class schools. They will always get cheated out of what they need.

Supporters of Neighborhood Schools respond: Neighborhood schools will only be
second class if we let them. The Black community has a responsibility to its children
to continue to be vigilant and fight for justice and equity. We need to demand that we
have the facilities, the resources, the equipment and the instructional programs that
our children need to get a first rate education. Where some of our children need more
resources because of their home situations or because of the history of discrimination
and inequity in the schools, we should insist that they get it. We cannot concede the
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responsibility to get our children what they need to the white parents by thinking that
their mere presence will insure that our children will get it.

Where we have had bussing and racial balance, our children have still gotten second-
class education even within white schools. Being in racially balanced schools has not
guaranteed good educations. In asking for schools in our neighborhoods, we as a
community are asking for more control over our children's education, not less. Cer-
tainly we should not concede that our children are better off if other people have
more control of their education than we do. That seems to be what the proponents of
bussing are saying.

Opponents of Neighborhood Schools say: Neighborhood schools will be segregated
schools since neighborhoods are segregated.

Supporters of Neighborhood Schools respond: While that sounds true, in a sense it is
not. The type of segregation that neighborhoods have is a type of defacto segregation
that is not the universal law of the land. In fact some neighborhoods are identifiably
Black and some are identifiably white, and some are neither. Some of the schools
with assignment plans based on neighborhoods would be majority white, some ma-
jority Black and some would be well mixed. That is not what the school segregation
that people fought and died to end was like. Those of us who are old enough to re-
member, or who have carefully grasped the history of that period know that schools
were segregated PERIOD. That was the law. The struggle was to end those laws, and
to open those doors of opportunity to our children.

Once the doors were open, it was another question whether or not to force some
children to go through those doors. We did not force anyone to take advantage of
laws integrating public accommodations. We did not force anyone to take advantage
of laws against discrimination in voting. We did not force anyone to take advantage
of open housing laws. It was only with school integration that some people feel it is
justified to force children to go to schools they don't want to go to in order to ad-
vance our civil rights.

 Opponents of Neighborhood Schools say: Going back to Neighborhood schools
would be turning back the clock on the progress we have made with race relations.

Supporters of Neighborhood Schools respond: There are two things wrong with this
statement. First, you can't go back where you have never been. We have never had
neighborhood schools. Black children were regularly bused past white schools near
their homes to the Negro schools that the law assigned them to. If that were not the
case, there would not have been a Brown v Board case in Topeka Kansas in 1954
where the young Miss Brown lived closer to the white school she was denied entry
to. If she could have gone to school in her neighborhood her daddy would not have
needed to sue the school board. If there had been neighborhood schools, most of the
Little Rock 9 would have already been able to go to Little Rock Central High School
and President Eisenhower would not have had to send the 101st Airborne to let those
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children into school. Neighborhood schools as we are describing them would have
satisfied much of what we were struggling for as it related to school assignment. The
need would have still existed as it does now to exercise more control over what is
going on in those schools, but that is a different, though related fight.

The second problem with the turning back the clock argument is that for far too
many of our children, the clock never went forward. The quality of the education that
too many of our children received in the racially balanced schools that they attended
was not adequate and represent ed no substantial progress for them over the type of
education they received in the segregated schools of the past. In fact I would argue
that many segregated school systems did a better job of educating our children than
the current integrated system is doing. That is not to say that we should return to seg-
regation, but it does say we should stop talking about progress that hasn't been made
yet.

Opponents of Neighborhood Schools say: Even with neighborhood schools, some
children will be forced to go to schools in their neighborhood when they don't want
to. There will always be someone who is dissatisfied.

Supporters of Neighborhood Schools respond: All the schools, regardless of the
neighborhood they are in should be good schools. This will go a long way toward
ending the dissatisfaction of those who don't want to go to a particular school. For
others who would still like to go elsewhere, there need to be a range of educational
choices available to children who for various reasons don't want to go to the school
in their neighborhood. There should be special theme schools in the Arts, and in Sci-
ence and Technology or Language Arts. Even in schools having a special theme,
there should be all round instruction in basic subjects. These schools would differ
from Magnet schools in that their purpose would not be primarily for increasing di-
versity and bringing white students into Black neighborhoods, but they should be
high quality programs to enhance the education of the children and give them more
choice.

Opponents of Neighborhood Schools say: All of this misses the point. Just having
neighborhood schools won't cure everything. Look at Dudley. It still has problems.
We need more money and better facilities and better programs.

Supporters of Neighborhood Schools respond: Yes, Dudley still has problems al-
though it cannot really be called a neighborhood school. Too many children in
Morningside Homes and other low-income neighborhoods are excluded from going
there. In addition, the community input and control is not what it needs to be. It is
true that we need more money, better facilities and better academic programs. We
must continue to fight for those things. We also need our schools in our communities
as institutions that help anchor the community and give it pride and stability. With
busing we gave up too many of our institutions. Many of our communities had
nothing left in them that we could take any pride in. It is true that neighborhood
schools will not cure everything but they put us in a better position to fight for what
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we need. When we get in that position it is still important that we get involved in that
fight for our children's needs and their survival.

Opponents of Neighborhood Schools say: All of the supporters of neighborhood
schools support segregation.

Supporters of Neighborhood Schools respond: That is simply not true. Segregation
was and is wrong. Many of us were part of the fight against it and will continue to
fight it. No child should be excluded from any school or any school activity because
of his race. Wanting to see schools rebuilt in our communities, and see children edu-
cated near their homes does not mean supporting segregation. We think that the best
way to have deeply involved communities that will see to it that our children are re-
spected, nurtured, and armed with the tools and skills they need to succeed is by
having community control of neighborhood schools. The opponents of neighborhood
schools would put that responsibility in the hands of someone else.
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People's Power - Not all Votes are Created Equal

August 21, 2002

In the development of real "people's power", it should be noted that not all votes are
created equal. The real process of "empowerment" needs to include "consensus" pro-
cesses that recognize this inequity of abstractly equal representation. Demagogy, and
rule by political polling both err in the direction of the western, electoral democracy
paradigm. "One man, one vote" emerged as a slogan for democracy but conceals the
real inter-relationship of people deciding and uniting around their real needs and in-
terests.

Some young people were once asked how they would decide which movie to go to if
it turned our that they did not all agree initially on the one they wanted to see. One
person suggested that they would vote. On digging a little deeper, it was revealed
that while this answer sounded like what the interlocutor wanted, the truth is that
they actually seldom voted in such a situation. The real process was different. Not
everyone felt as strongly as the others about their choices. After a discussion, it could
even end up being the movie that would have received the least votes that is finally
agreed on, if the advocate for that movie makes a good case for why it would be the
best one to go to, and the others trust the honesty of his opinions and welcome the
new information.

What does it mean to say that some people feel more strongly about their views than
others? What is the significance of the fact that some have thought more about their
views than others? Should all know the basis for the views and attitudes of each
other? Wouldn't that be an important part of trying to make the best decision?

The fallacy of contemporary public-opinion-polling lies in the notion that in a ran-
dom telephone call, made to someone at dinnertime, interrupting his watching the
network news, he is likely to express a view more profound than a simple reflection
of the prejudices expounded by the mass media in its version of what is happening in
the world - the news. In some sense, "polling" then is a reflection of itself, since the
same basic method is used to determine what is "news". [Or the view that the sum of
many superficial opinions is a profound opinion rather than the average of a lot of
superficiality.] To avoid thinking of this in a purely circular fashion, it can also be
seen that the interests of the rich and powerful who own and hence control the vehi-
cles for both the polling and the mass media are expressed in a weighted manner, but
with a weight not connected to deeper contemplation of the issues at hand, but rather
with the weight of their narrower class interests.

The truth is that a lot of people are not sure what they think. Efforts are made to
sway their opinion one way or the other, but the methods to do that are not widely or
equitably available. It becomes very important to create the mechanism by which
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people can engage in "deep" discussion of issues before coming to a conclusion, and
not allowing the inertia of "prevailing" opinions to hold the day by default.

When an African village was being introduced to the idea of western type democ-
racy, some of the people laughed and asked "Why should the view of a youth be
treated as though it was as important as the view of an elder?"

Wisdom vs. honesty

In the contest between the elder and the youth, the elder has more access to experi-
ence, but is also more likely to be tainted by it. We could conclude that this averages
out, and that the youth and the elder have equally valid since equally flawed ap-
proaches to things, but this can lead to a method that maximizes the worst of both of
their contributions.

What is needed is for the elder to have the opportunity to lay his experience and un-
derstanding on the table, and for the youth, informed by it to lay his connection with
the future and lack of cynicism there along with it, to decide what to do. Instead of
this, we often find ways of combining the cynicism of old age with the inexperience
of youth and get the worst of all possible worlds.

Consensus processes

In the struggle for consensus, all views and all the involved people are respected.
Avoiding "winners and losers" is the desired outcome. The final decision needs to be
one that all can say "I can live with that". Even when it is necessary to reserve full
support for an idea.
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Some Notes on Segregation

March 3, 1999

The use of some words causes a lot of confusion because these words carry with
them the weight of everyone's history, interpretation and misinterpretation. Such
words don't provide much clarity and often when used, require more work to explain
what is meant than would be required to rephrase the discussion in other language. In
the context of dealing with redistricting and neighborhood schools, such a word is
"segregation". Recently, there has been a lot of discussion about neighborhood
schools and segregation. It has been said that by asking to go "back to neighborhood
schools", we are asking for "resegregation". In this paper, I will explain my view of
part of what is at stake. Very briefly, my view on segregation and neighborhood
schools is as follows:

*       Advocating neighborhood schools is not the same as advocating segregation.
*       We can't "go back" to neighborhood schools, because we have never had them.
*       "Neighborhood schools" are different from the "segregated schools" many of

us fought to end.
*       The type of "segregation" that exists in neighborhoods is qualitatively different

from the "segregation" that once characterized our school systems.
*       The argument that "neighborhood schools will be segregated schools because

neighborhoods are segregated" is sophistry and creates a lot of confusion. It
does this by calling two very different things - "neighborhood segregation" as
it exists today and "school segregation" as it existed 45 years ago - by the same
name. They are different, and what needs to be done about them, is different.

*       What our children need, can be better addressed in neighborhood schools even
though we will still need to be vigilant and continue to struggle for equity and
justice and expanded opportunity for all our children.

*       By continuing to put the main load of the burden to integrate the society on our
children, we are setting many of those children up to fail.

*       In the fight against Jim Crow, in no institution other than education have
Blacks been forced to integrate with whites.

*       So much confusion has been generated that even old style segregation - ex-
cluding Black children from some schools and school programs because of
their race -- has been used as a tool to help further "integration".

*       The key to racial harmony and understanding is the interaction of people of dif-
ferent races as equals. This will for some require a period of preparation and
development during which there may be some voluntary separation of people.

*       We should encourage the development of the institutions that allow our young
people to be nurtured, loved and to grow into their full potential as the real
preparation for integration and diversity.
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The remainder of this paper is a collection of notes and thoughts that help explain
why I feel the way that is expressed in bullet points above. (I will not dwell too
deeply on the essential characteristics of education and what our neighborhood
schools should be like here. That is done in a separate paper called "Some Educa-
tional Principles.")

1. To segregate (v) is to separate. And "segregation" is simply the fact of things
being separated. Implicit in this notion is the separation of parts into like groups.
This is a process of selection and choice, and it also requires the capacity to
judge "likeness" of things. Many times it is in the judgment of likeness (or in the
prejudgment of it) that the difficulty lies. Some people often assume the exis-
tence of characteristics that are reliably predicted by the race of another. This is
the basic racialist assumption. There are in fact very few things that we know
about someone simply by knowing his race.

2. All of life is about selection and choices. All of our associations are connected
with some sense of selection, choice and judgment about what people are like
and which people are alike. We would typically choose to engage in conversation
with people with whom we share some common interests. No one questions this.
No one usually calls this segregation, except when the selection always ends up
reflecting separation along lines commonly called "race". We regularly handle
our social associations along lines that discriminate (another word for choose)
among all the possible associations. Some factors include religious affiliation -
Catholic, Baptist, Buddhist, Moslem or AME, etc., taste in music - country, rap,
jazz, R&B, Classical, or gospel etc., interests - hunting, fishing, Carolina Basket-
ball, or A&T Football. There is something profoundly American about our free-
dom of association. All these associations at some level lead to some level of
segregation, because we select and associate with these "like" groups. All of
these associations flow in some way from our reaching some conclusion what
people are like and how they are alike. We do this either by judging on the basis
of what we know about the people or prejudging on the basis of no facts but
rather assumptions as to what is likely to be the case. This "prejudgment" is the
root of "prejudice".

3. The most segregated hour in America has been described as being 11 AM on
Sunday. The idea that people choosing to worship separately is a big problem is
open to debate. The fact of the matter is that white people would be welcomed in
the overwhelmi ng majority of Black churches in America on any Sunday. It is
probably also true that very few white churches would refuse to welcome Black
worshipers. There is much to be said about the liturgical traditions that people
feel comfortable with and the right of people in America to worship as they
chose with whom they chose. Certainly this type of "segregation" does not merit
the disdain that is appropriate when looking at the way schools were segregated.
In fact, there is nothing wrong with people being among themselves on the basis
of things they have in common. I also doubt that many people would want to ar-



54

gue that separate churches, even those with fewer resources are "inherently une-
qual".

4. Not all separation of people is wrong. There is some "segregation" based on
clear-cut physical factors, particularly gender. We maintain separate toilet facili-
ties for males and for females. At one time there was an accepted practice of
having separate educational facilities for males and females too. At the time
some of these institutions based their existence on assumptions of differences in
what males and females need to know. This in no longer as widely accepted as it
once was, but it was certainly a form of segregation, some of which still exists.

5. There is "segregation" and there is "segregation". All segregation is not created
equal. Forty-five years ago there existed throughout the American south a dual
and segregated, separate and unequal school system that maintained schools for
Negro children and schools for white children. That was the law of the land in
many southern and Border States. That system denied the basic rights of the
Black community to equal access to educational facilities. Schools in the Black
community ended up with second hand and second-rate equipment, books, fa-
cilities and instructional programs. Schools for Negroes, as we were called then,
were established to prepare us for a subservient role in society. We were only to
be trained to be the "hewers of wood and the drawers of water". We were not
trained to be scientists or doctors or political leaders or civil rights activists. We
were only trained to fit into the social role of second class citizens that had been
proscribed for us. It was against that segregated Jim Crow educational system
that a massive struggle was organized including the courts, the legislatures and
the streets. At the root of that struggle was the question of the denial of opportu-
nity. The object of the struggle was opening doors to institutions that had been
closed to us. Laws existed that forced Black people to stay out of institutions that
we felt afforded us more opportunity for success in life because they gave us a
better education. Education was seen as a key to success. Very few Black people
would have sacrificed very much for the right to rub shoulders with whites. The
struggle was for open access to educational opportunity. This became obscured
and perverted when the struggle against segregation turned toward the struggle
for racial balance and bussing became its chief tool. It was then that we moved
away from opening doors and instead began forcing people through them.

6. Sometimes the separation process involves an element of coercion. Even coer-
cion is not always wrong. We lock the doors of our homes to exclude people who
are not in our families from entering. That is OK. In the past the doors of some
schools were "locked" to exclude children of other races from entering. That was
not OK. It was reprehensible and morally repugnant.

7. The segregated school system was coercive. It used the force of law and lynch
mob enforcement of that law to keep Black children away from access to educa-
tion in white institutions. Such a system was, and is wrong. Black children had to
pass by white schools to go to materially inferior ones that were set up especially
for them because Black inferiority was an accepted social and legal norm in this
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country. Children could not go to schools in their neighborhoods unless those
schools were the ones designated for people of their race. Every time I hear
someone talk about "returning to neighborhood schools", I wonder what they are
talking about. When did we ever have neighborhood schools? My family lived
closer to the "white" Little Rock Central High School than to the Black Horace
Mann High. If there had been neighborhood schools in Little Rock, you would
have never heard of the Little Rock "9". The little Brown girl, whose parents
sued the board of Education in Topeka, Kansas, lived right across the street from
a school where she was denied entry. If there had been neighborhood schools
there, there would not have been a Brown v. Board of Ed. Neighborhood schools
have not been tried and failed. They have never been tried.

8. But, some will say, 'neighborhood schools will be segregated schools since
neighborhoods are segregated'. As I said earlier, there is segregation and there is
segregation. Not all segregation is created equal. Neighborhoods are separated by
a number of factors: cost of housing separates where people live by income. Race
is a major factor in the income disparity between people, but certainly not the
only one. History, culture, economics and some other factors separate people in
where they live by race. There was a time when the law separated where people
lived simply by the color of their skin. Housing discrimination was legal and
common. It is now against the law for some one to refuse to sell another a house
because of his race. This law has not led to a rapid integration of housing pat-
terns. Some people chose to stay in their community where they know people
and are comfortable. There have been many others who have moved out of the
traditional Black community over the last 40 years because it is legal to do so,
because they have the economic where-with-all to do so, and because they chose
to.

9. There is probably much more neighborhood integration today than ever before,
but there is still not much. So, if we have school attendance based on neighbor-
hood it would be reflective of the patterns that exist in housing and that would
mean that there would not be an equal or near equal balance in the racial make-
up of schools. Is that the same as the school segregating we fought against? Or
isn't using "segregation" in these two different ways a play on words that leads to
confusing some different concepts?

10. In all fairness, we should also ask if there are profound negative consequences of
"defacto segregation" even if it is different from what was struggled against in
the south and Border States in the 1950's and 1960's? Those who would argue
that separate education is "inherently unequal" might say that this is so. But we
should remember that in many parts of the world there are no white people. We
would necessarily be among ourselves while we are being educated. Are we
saying that Blacks will always get an inferior education there? There are towns in
the USA that are virtually all Black. Are we saying that the children of those
towns will always get an inferior education to the white children in all white
towns? There are communities in side many large cities that are virtually all
Black. Are we saying that the children in those communities cannot be properly
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educated without importing some white kids into their schools? I think not. It
should be evident that we can have schools that educate our children well re-
gardless of the racial composition of the school. This has been proven repeatedly
by our history and the current experience of schools at all levels. In the 1890's
when Washington DC was strictly segregated, the one Black school there had
higher achievement levels than 2 of the three white schools there. There are
overwhelmingly Black schools in Chicago whose test scores on standardized
tests are in the upper 10 percent of all the schools in the city. These examples
while not exhaustive are certainly too few. But they do prove that schools that do
not have the proper ratio of Black and white children are still capable of educat-
ing our kids. We have certainly proven over the last 30 years that children in
schools that are racially balanced do not necessarily get a good education. If our
children are not being educated well, then something else is wrong outside of the
racial composition of the school and we should fix it.

11. We should be mindful of the fact that some people are always susceptible to con-
fusion, and that some people wanted to end segregation precisely so that they and
their children could be next to white people. But that is not the stuff that you can
build mass movements out of. It should be remembered that in no arena of
American life other than grade school education did the courts pursue the inte-
gration of the races beyond the removal of the Jim Crow barriers that character-
ized the segregated system. When we won the access to public accommodations,
no one mandated that that access had to be used. No one set up ratios for balanc-
ing hotel room rentals, or restaurant dining. No one tried to require that a certain
number of Blacks should ride on previously segregated busses. All that was re-
quired was that the barriers be removed. Nowhere, but in the arena of education
was a decision made to mandate the mixing of the races. Why do we put this
burden on our children to do something that is done nowhere else? {see magnet
schools using segregation to advance integration below}

12. Of course there is an argument to be made for diversity. People can and should
learn from each other. Cross-cultural contact is an important part of the overall
educational process and is very important in a multicultural society. But as we
seek these advantages we must ask the price. Certainly it would be unfair to
Black students if we required them to accept a status of a lab experiment to be
studied and examined for other's education. Certainly it would be unfair to them
if we required that they always explain or defend the actions and attitudes of all
the other members of their race. Certainly it would be unfair to them if we con-
sistently put them in situations where the economic disparity between their com-
munities and others was an ongoing source of ridicule. But we have done all
these things and more in the name of diversity.

13. We still have to ask ourselves, is it simply contact between people, or is it the
interaction of different people as equals that builds understanding and respect
among the races? I would argue the latter. During slavery there was a consider-
able amount of contact at all levels (economic, social, and personal intimacy)
between Blacks and whites, yet no mutual respect emerged. Each party acted out
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his role in a historically staged play with the predictabl e consequence that eve-
ryone's preconceived notion was reinforced by what he saw. It was like actors
standing behind their masks in a Greek play where their real features and their
real humanity was invisible to the audience. This is pretty much what has been
observed in many of the relations developed in public schools in the period of
forced bussing. White students and teachers who think of Black people as lazy
and ignorant have been reinforced in that self-fulfilling perception by what they
saw in these institutions that they had created for themselves. To the extent that
many Black youth felt alienated and abused by the educational system, their be-
havior in response to this was seen by whites as proof of the existing stereotypes.
Black people who felt that whites were hostile, insensitive and deceptive felt jus-
tified with their observance of the conduct of many white students playing out
those roles.

14. (I keep saying “many” because nothing is universally true of everyone. There
will always be some anecdotal evidence of improved relations between individ-
ual students, but I will bet, that if you go into one of the "racially balanced"
schools in this county today, you will observe Black students largely staying to
themselves and white students largely doing the same. If you were to interview
students of either race you will find that each hold the basic stereotype views that
I have mentioned, even though there will be some exceptions to the rule. To
some degree, what I am describing happens the least when smaller numbers of
Blacks are assimilated into white institutions. There, there is more of an opportu-
nity that their humanity will show, but also a great possibility that this heightened
understanding is bought at a price of greater alienation of those Blacks from their
own community. It is almost as some of us are told "You'd be alright if you
would stay away from those other niggers." Sadly, some of us fall for it.)

15. What is really required to build true understanding and respect among people is
interaction as equals. This can only happen when our youth feel self-confident,
develop identity, pride and a sense of themselves and have their creative energies
are unleashed. Supportive and nurturing neighborhood schools play a role in cre-
ating the atmosphere in which this can take place. We also need more situations
and processes where people come into contact with each other as equals. The
public schools have so far proven not to be very good at this. The task of creating
opportunities for interaction as equals may be difficult at first, given the history
of racism, cultural isolation and cultural chauvinism. But it can and must be
worked out.

16. Let's look at "segregated" housing. No one who is serious questions that some
people can afford some things, and not others. It can and should be pointed out
that the current economic disparity is too wide, and is itself unjust. We need to
find ways to narrow that gap - between the haves and the have-not's. For many of
us, the struggle around good education is a part of that fight. It is connected with
expanding the opportunity of those with limited financial resources to provide an
education for their children to go further than they did in life. The question is can
we put housing segregation, as it is a result of that economic disparity, in the
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same category as racial segregation in the schools? I think not. People can and do
change their economic status and with that they change their options as to where
they will live. People cannot typically change their race, nor would most of us
want to even if we could. One type of "segregation" is a dynamic factor con-
nected with choices as well as opportunities as well as fate, the other is simply a
fact of history and genetics and politics of racial definition. (I have to say that
because "race" is not nearly so much a "fact" as it is made out to be. Racial defi-
nitions vary from state to state in the USA and vary even more widely in other
countries around the world. The definitions are themselves a product of the his-
tory of the development of economic and social relations in a place. But the defi-
nitions are fixed not just in law but also in the consciousness of people, and could
not be simply changed by decree.)

17. Do people who want neighborhood schools want segregation? The answer de-
pends on whom you are talking about. It is almost certainly the case that some
whites who are not satisfied with the result of the struggle to integrate public
education and are uncomfort able about their children associating with Black
children see neighborhood schools as a way to avoid contact with Black children.
However despicable we may find this, this is not the same as wanting to return to
the old days of dejure (by law) segregation. There are social conditions that have
led some middle class and upper class Black folks to not want their children in
school with poor Black kids. The palatable explanation is that we are not talking
about race, we are talking about economics. Certainly, this too is a form of seg-
regation, and it is just about as despicabl e from middle class Blacks as it is from
whites who tend to lump all Black folks together. If some of these white people
were questioned closely, we would probably find that they do not mind their kids
spending time around the children of Black doctors and lawyers and engineers,
either. But back to the question of neighborhood schools and segregation: The
bulk of Blacks who want neighborhood schools are not hard line Black nationa l-
ists. Rather, they are people who think that we in the Black community must take
much of the responsibility for educating our children, and that the school institu-
tions should be more closely connected to communities and held accountab le to
them.

18. There is also the question if neighborhoods are segregated and this would lead to
schools being segregated, why are we making children bear the brunt of int e-
grating our community whole? Why don't we require that adults go to Laundro-
mats and grocery stores that are not near their homes so we can increase the in-
teraction between Blacks and whites? Why don't we force people to be bused or
drive to assigned libraries and churches? Most would think such rules silly. They
are. But isn't it silly to force children to integrate buildings when the programs in
those buildings remain segregated ostensibly by ability groupings, but objec-
tively by race? How satisfying is that situation? What good did it ever do to have
a magnet school in a Black community with a small attendance zone around that
school then have functionally two different schools operating inside the same
building? We ended up with a white and middle class Black magnet program and
a poor Black regular school with many children in special-ed and remedial
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classes all housed under one roof? What did they share - the lunchroom? So
what? Maybe if you averaged all the standardized test scores, you would end up
with the achievement levels in the Black neighborhood improving. O what evil
lurks inside the statistics we give so much credence to.

19. Split sessions, and space science -1957 Sputnik. As recently as the 1960's some
school districts in the south had what were known as "split sessions" for their
Black schools. There were long school breaks in the spring and again in the fall
for cultivation and then harvesting the prevailing agricultural crop. This placed
the education of Black children in a clearly subordinate position to the mainte-
nance of the economy. White children in the same areas remained in school. This
situation was so bad in some school districts that by the ninth grade some Black
children had only been in school as long as white children had by the sixth grade.

20. The launching of Sputnik in 1957 was part of the beginning of the end of this
process. America's backwardness in the space race caused many educators to re-
think the educational levels of Americans in general. Science kits began to be
widespread in elementary schools. New Math that went beyond the rote recita-
tion of arithmetic tables gained ascendancy. Part of the fight against segregation
must be viewed in this context. Where we had a school system that was part of
the limiting of our horizons, we had a need to fight. We had to expand the op-
portunities to our children to be prepared for the world introduced by Sputnik,
and not just for the cotton fields, and the tobacco fields.

21. Education has been for the status quo in the dominant society. Education has
been used as a tool for social control in a society that was built on domination
and exploitation. But when we look at fighting against segregation as a part of
moving our people forward, the key question is whether we are fighting against
or defending the status quo in society. That status quo has Black people on the
bottom in America and throughout the world. Our proper education needs to
speak to that fact and how to end it, rather than just how to fit into it. It is pretty
clear that (Black Liberation) is not the principle orientation of the white schools
we integrated into. While some skills and some information were available in
white schools that were more difficult to attain in Black schools, the intent of
those schools was never to facilitate the utilization of that information and those
skills in the interest of our community. That would have required a process ex-
ternal to the newly integrated white schools that oriented our young people to
their responsibilities to their community, much like the better Black educators
had attempted to do during the period of strict segregation. Such a mechanism
did not come into being. Instead there was complacency on the part of some of
our leadership that things would be OK now that our children were where the
money was.

22. There are those who argue against neighborhood schools by saying "to fight Jim
Crow, you go where the money is". Their argument for bussing children to ra-
cially balance schools is that we must put our children in the white schools, be-
cause that is where the money is. The assumption is that if white people don't
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have their children in a school, at best our children will be neglected. Even in the
years after the Brown v. Board decision, when there were open assignment poli-
cies that allowed children the choice of which school they would attend, some
folks looked at the remaining patterns of school attendance, saw that the majority
of Black children were in schools that they had historically been assigned to and
complained that these children would never receive the benefits of integration.
They felt that since there were no white children in their schools, they would re-
ceive an inherently inferior education and they would not receive the resources
that white people had for their children in their schools. The resulting struggles
for racial balance in schools were largely carried out in the courts with numerous
decisions coming down that attacked "defacto segregation" and mandated school
bussing plans and the establishment of school balance goals. This was never a
mass struggle. Most Black families had "voted with their feet" when they left
their children in the traditionally Black schools. It is erroneous to talk about peo-
ple in our community having fought and died over school bussing. It did not hap-
pen.

23. It is also clear from the last 30 years of forced bussing, that being where the
money was did not guarantee a quality education. Tracking, magnet programs,
ADHD classes, Academically Gifted programs selection procedures, suspensions
and expulsions and simple neglect in the classroom were all parts of the mecha-
nisms that prevented many of our children from getting all that they needed even
when they were in a school where the money was.

24. Magnet schools were developed as a method of achieving integration and diver-
sity without forced bussing. The idea was to create "super schools" using the lat-
est innovation, best teachers and best resources and put these schools inside the
Black community to attract white students. Seats in these schools were set aside
for the white students who were being sought. It is ironic that one of the results
of a struggle for access to better educational resources for Black children was the
establishment of institutions, in our community, not for the purpose of better
educating Black children, but rather for the purpose of attracting white children.
There were instances where quotas were established and Black children were ex-
cluded from magnet school programs in their communities for the purpose of
saving spaces for white children who did not want to go. This was the insanity of
using segregation - the forceful exclusion of some children because of their race -
to fight for integration - the mixing of Black and white children in school build-
ings. It never did make much sense, but when it was questioned, the response
came back that the federal guidelines required it.

25. Two things are wrong with this magnet school concept. First, if we know better
what children really need for their education, we have a responsibility to pro-
vided it for all the children, not just for a select few. Second, it obviously makes
no sense at all to seek to correct the exclusion of Black children by excluding
them from the best schools that were placed in their communities. The result of
the magnet process was as ridiculous as the assumptions upon which it rested.
We ended up with two separate schools, one overwhelmingly Black, the other
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sometimes majority white, with different teachers and different classrooms for
different students all housed under one roof, sharing toilet and lunch facilities.

26. Going hungry is not good preparation for famine. The idea that we should throw
our children into hostile educational environment s at an early age so they can
learn to deal with the racism and hostility of the society is foolishness. You don't
practice for a famine by fasting. All that might do is condition you to the pain
you will encounter but it will not give you the stored up nutrition that will allow
you to get through it. It is better to overeat for a while, if you know you are going
where food is scarce. Our children will see enough real racism, discrimination
and isolation in the world as adults. As children we need to fill them so full of
themselves that they are self- confident and no one can make them doubt them-
selves and their full humanity. That is why the idea of a wholesome, nurturing
educational environment is so important. When our children face the irrationality
and insanity of the society, they should question the society and not themselves.
It is out of this questioning of the society with a deep sense of commitment and
responsibility to the community that we can inspire the creative thinking required
to give some answers to the question of how can we fix what is wrong.

27. There is still a need today to direct the efforts to educate our youth toward a type
of education that concerns them with freedom and the equality of man and the
uplifting of their communities.

28. Neighborhood schools will not cure all the problems of education. By them-
selves, they will not cure any of the things wrong with education. Why you may
ask are some people putting so much emphasis on them then? For two reasons.
First, these are our children. We have a responsibility to them that goes beyond
that of anyone else. In order for us to discharge this responsibility, we need them
in our community in institutions that we as a community can influence and con-
trol. Second, we need to reinvolve our whole community with all of its parts. The
best conditions under which we can do this is with institutions in the community
that are the focus of our efforts. All that neighborhood schools will do is set up
better conditions for the struggle that will have to go on anyway. The struggle to
get parents and businessmen and businesswomen and working people and
churches more involved with children is an ongoing struggle. The struggle for
equity in funding, facilities, and program is an ongoing struggle. The struggle for
the minds of our children from all the self-destructive forces and temptations that
they find all around them is an ongoing struggle.

29. We have a need to inspire young people and get them thinking about the realities
of the world they live in and how those realities affect their community. We need
to help them make decisions about how they will fit into the labor force or the
business world of tomorrow on the basis of an informed view of what is going
on. We need to expose our young people to the possibility of their own success.
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30. We have to move in this direction if we are to prepare our youth for democracy,
citizenship and adulthood as opposed to preparing them for submission, oppres-
sion, dependency, social pathology and childishness.
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Are we meeting their needs?

November 6, 2003

A couple of weeks ago I got to meet with some of the young men at Dudley High
School who had been at A&T State University for one of the new college based high
school programs like the ones at Guilford College, Bennett College and Greensboro
College. This particular group had been sent back to Dudley after being identified as
discipline problems on the College campus. I found the 15 of them I met with under
the auspices of a mentoring program to be attentive, intelligent and polite.

After I described to them some of the high speed production equipment that I regu-
larly help to keep running in my industrial job and then told them that my company
does very little hiring, one of them asked me an astute question: "If they keep mak-
ing faster machines that don't need many people to run them, pretty soon no one will
have a job."

"You are exactly right," I told him. "That is almost certainly one of the biggest
problems in the 21st century, and you young men will have to help figure out how to
solve it."

We really need to understand the importance of these young men. I had met one of
them several weeks earlier, shortly after they were sent back to Dudley. "Do you
really want me to tell you what happened," he began as he proceeded to tell me what
had gone on. "When we got there, there were no books, no teachers and no rooms
assigned to some of our classes. They didn't have anything for us."

It seems that this program expanded from a successful program with 25 students a
year ago to a failing program of 125 students a year later. I have been told that there
were federal funds available if the program was bigger than the pilot that had first
been established. But after getting the money for the program, someone dropped the
ball and forgot to make sure that the young people's needs were met. Whatever else
may be these young men's faults, only tended to worsen in a situation where it was
again clear to them that they were not deemed to be very important.

The fact is that they are important. Our inability to meet their needs today will not
make them go away tomorrow. They are a part of this community, and if properly
respected and properly treated they are a huge asset to the community. It will in fact
fall upon them to either solve the problems of the community or to be the problems
of the community. All too often, I think that some adult forget this.

I have seen email messages from distraught white parents who talked about the need
to put one of the middle schools under "martial law" in order to prevent the disrupt-
ers from keeping other students from learning. This doesn't strike me as being a very
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intelligent approach and in the concrete context that it emerges, it smacks a great
deal of racism and elitism.

What is the significance of some students learning and others not? Do we think that
if we ignore "bad kids" they will go away? Do we really think that we can intimidate
young people into "acting right"? Has anyone there spent much time with them ask-
ing them what they are interested in and how they think they might best learn what
will help them in the future?

I doubt it. I think that if they could find meaningful ways to communicate with the
young people without making baseless threats, they would find the same thing that I
found when talking to the young men at Dudley.

It doesn't take all that much to get them thinking about this community and it's eco-
nomic and social future. It isn't hard to get them interested in planning for how they
would like to prepare themselves for tomorrow. It is not that hard to get them to look
at some of the ways that grown folks have messed up the world and to begin thinking
about what needs to be done to fix it.

If adults involved in educating young people could only appreciate the natural ten-
dency of youth to seek to please adults and acquire their skills and power, we would
be able to find ways to effectively deal with them. In this current climate, however of
"zero-tolerance" and high-stakes-standardized testing it is hard to do what is needed.
We need to sit back, though and remember how important young people are and in-
vite them to become a part of our strategizing to make a better world.
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Not Knowing What You Are Missing

December, 2003

Looking at the commercialization of Christmas and thinking of all of the parents
going into debt to secure toys, trinkets, and designer clothes for their children makes
me want to find a different way of looking at these things.

It doesn't take very long for all of the "new" to wear off the things they just had to
have, and the children with too much stuff soon find themselves frustrated and empty
feeling again - feeling worse even than the children who are not confronted with
these excesses.

If you think that the "wants" which are induced by this consumer culture are natural,
it may seem that those who do not participate in the splendors of modern society are
really missing something. On the other hand, the same thing can be said about those
who don't know the intensely pleasing "rush" of a good dose of heroin. A character
in a recent movie "Trainspotting," dealing with the British drug-culture, described
"shooting up" as more than a thousand times better than the best orgasm.

If we were offered the opportunity, many of us who are afraid of drugs would "pass"
on finding out how good it feels,. That is because we know that the experience, how-
ever wonderful it might be for a few moments, is not sustainable. It is bad for you
because it may be found to be so pleasurable that it distorts the balance of all of the
rest of your life and effectively drives you mad.

The same thing can be said of modern consumer society which in many ways is
much like a dose of heroin. When we look at the worldwide requirements for our
consumerism, we see that it too is not sustainable. While it may be pleasurable, it is
not good for us because it distorts reality in a serious way.

I once asked my father who was born in 1909 to tell me about his memories of seg-
regation and poverty as a child since I knew that he grew up in a poor black family in
the south during some of the worst days of Jim Crow segregation.

"We didn't think much about it," he told me. "We just went out with our friends and
played."

In my father's generation there were no children who were too poor to have toys. No,
they didn't have much money, but the idea of not having anything to play with would
have been incomprehensible. Children made their own toys. A ball was made from
rags and string. A hoop could be made from supple branches an old barrel or an old
bicycle wheel. All that was required was a space, and other children wanting to have
fun. Their bodies were exercised and their minds challenged by the creation of their
own toys and by the games of agility and strategy they played with them.
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Today, if a child's parents cannot afford a Super-Duper Nintendo, or a PlayStati on-
99 so that he can sit still for hours in front of a television screen killing villains or
causing mayhem while growing obese from the junk food that he or she periodically
interrupting their play retrieve from the refrigera tor, then they feel deprived.

These "needs" for special kinds of toys that are fashionable for the moment, like the
corresponding "needs" for designer clothes and sugary, greasy fast-food are created
by a social/economic mechanism that is dependent on creating the demand then
struggling to satisfy it and in doing so creating "winners and losers." -those who can
keep up with the TV ads and the vast majority who go deep into debt trying to do so.

Can we honestly say that this is progress?

How very far away we are from the notion espoused by some Quakers of "living
simply so that others may simply live".

Those of us who feel that we could not go back to living simply, should think of the
junkie. Every day that he uses drugs, he moves further and further away from feeling
like he would ever be able to do without them.

This holiday season, look at the children coming down from their "consumer/toy
highs" and think again of that junkie when his high wears off.

The parallel is striking. There is something to be said for not knowing what you are
missing.
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The New Empire and Our Challenges

Speech Delivered at Guilford College

March 5, 2003

We always find ourselves at a particular juncture of time and space. We are right
here right now. The tasks of living in the present and accepting the challenges of our
moment and place require us to look around us and at ourselves and understand
where we are, what is going on, what are the needs, what are our capacities and what
will we accept as our responsibilities.

In my late teens and early twenties I lived in the South of largely defeated and dying
Jim Crow; in the nation of a declining manufacturing base leading to urban decay,
discontent and rebellions, and in the world of the cold war on the one hand and
growing national liberation movements in Asia, Africa and Latin America on the
other. In particular there was our country's aggression in Vietnam that tore the fabric
of calm and tranquility and exposed the contradictions inherent in our attempt to be
the new colonial power. I became an early peace advocate, a black student leader, a
Black Nationalist activist supporting African Liberation struggles then later a labor
activist/organizer and a community activist and writer dealing with questions of ur-
ban redevelopment and education. Now I find myself back again working on matters
of international peace and opposing my government's aggressive posture in the
world.

For each of you, the question of what is going on now in the world and what will be
your role is one of the most important things that you can spend your time thinking
about.

Toward that end I have some observations and some challenges that I would like to
share with you.

We are witnessing the consolidation of the New United States of American Empire.
(NUSAE)

The only future peace in the world that we are offered is a US version of "Pax Ro-
mano" - "the peace of Rome." It is the "peace of the empire." It is the peace that fol-
lows the conquest of the weak by the strong and the submission of the powerless to
the needs and interests of the most powerful in the world.

Every corner of this planet is being reordered to suit the interest of the wealthiest few
of the international corporations headed by the most powerful forces in the USA.

Everything in the world that opposes US economic interests and political hegemony
is painted as "Evil."
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Everything that will not yield to the maximization of corporate profit is described as
a grave "danger" to us.

Today the USA is engaged in an illegal war in Iraq and threatening "preemptive"
strikes -- even possibly nuclear strikes -- against other countries (Iran, North Korea,
Syria, Philippines, Venezuela, Cuba) that are on its "hit list."

At home we are seeing the crushing of dissent and the abandonment of the rule of
law. The first amendment has become a conditional proposition that can be roped off
behind lines designated as "free speech zones" by the Secret Service and their local
deputies. (Do not forget the injuries of the hundreds of protestors last summer in
Oregon who "naively" thought that the US Constitution's 1st amendment gave them
the right to assemble and protest against the President of the United States).

Remember the names of Padillo and Hamdi. These men are US citizens who have
been denied access to legal redress in the US court system because they have been
merely accused (with no legal proof) of being domestic terrorists or illegal combat-
ants. Without our intervention, "Due Process of Law" will become a historical mem-
ory along with fins on big cars, the Charleston and powdered wigs on judges.

Education is becoming more and more a standardized process for dividing our youth
into "winners and losers" fitting them into their necessary social roles either in the
corporate world on the one hand or in the world of fast food on the other.

Rather than creative critical thinkers, our young people are being prepared to be sim-
ply consumers whose most important task is to chose between Coke and Pepsi, be-
tween Nike and Reebok, between McDonald's and Burger King and between Tommy
Hilfiger and Calvin Klein.

Our own version of "Ethnic Cleansing" is emptying communities of the poor to be-
come the new playgrounds and resting places for the emerging gentry.

The social "safety net" has been torn to shreds and those who have fallen through its
gaping holes are left to languish on the streets or else they are hidden out of the way
in "shelters" that have become temporary hells and holding cells on the way back to
the street or to jail.

Health care systems make promises that cannot be kept. They spend more and more
on extending the lives of the more affluent terminally ill while denying people the
basic dignity of respect and comfort for their infirmities as the mortality rate of the
poor continues to climb along with the profits of the health maintenance, insurance
and pharmaceutical companies.

The nation is waging a "war on drugs" that is in fact a "war on communities and
youth." Young people are daily trapped into a drug culture which is fueled by a com-
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bination of greed and despair. Too many of our young people live in neighborhoods
where the black market in drugs has become a major and integral part of the eco-
nomic distribution of the social product.

The prisons, often filled with non-violent victims of the "war on drugs," have be-
come the main "growth industries" in some communities. And sadly, prisons today
contain far too many of our young people. There are more young men of color in the
penal system than in the institutions of higher learning.

As the fabric of life has deteriorated, the police in many of our cities have gone wild,
doing in blue or black uniforms what was once only done under white sheets as a
means of social control to keep people "in their places."

Retirement incomes that many of our senior citizens depend upon are being com-
promised by inflation and scandalous stock market schemes of the "super-greedy". In
the light of these crooked schemes, small investor confidence has evaporated like the
morning dew in the heat of the sun.

Middle class jobs continue to disappear as investment capital takes the latest high
speed trip to "cheap-labor-land" on the vehicles of NAFTA, FTAA with the WTO
and the IMF serving as dutiful travel porters.

Low paying -"service sector" jobs are emerging but still leaving the employees
mostly unorganized, overworked, disrespected and poor.

There is an ongoing economic stagnation due to an economy that is capable of pro-
ducing far more goods than can possibly be sold since each year production increases
with fewer and fewer wage earners.

The G8, the WEF and the other assemblies of the world's richest meet in guarded
secrecy to nullify the needs and aspirations of the masses of people around the world,
who are becoming more and more superfluous to the economic designs of the mas-
ters of the world.

Tropical rainforests, the key to the bio-diversity of animals and plant life, as well as
the oceans fishes are all falling victim to the greed of a hand full of corporations who
are in the process of undoing in a few generations what has been developed and
nurtured by the world's indigenous people -- the peasants and particularly women --
over thousands of years.

People who have always been able to feed themselves are starving to death with the
growth of corporate agriculture taking over the world's food production and de-
stroying the world's people's time-tested traditional ways of life and livelihood.
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Energy is being utilized at an un-sustainable rate that causes the USA to stagger
around throughout the world like a bullying, dangerously armed and crazed drug ad-
dict looking for another cheap fix of fossil fuel.

As this happens, our nation's foreign and domestic policies are being systematic ally
reordered to serve that addiction.

Our country has such a level of waste and excessive consumption that if it were
achieved by all the world's people it would require 4 planets the size of the earth to
sustain that consumption.

Since raising the world to the level of Americans is not a possibility, we must look at
the military spending that is required to maintain the "disparity" in the use of the
world's resources as a large part of the basic cost of "The American Way of Life."

Our military spends more on arms and preparation for war than the next 7 largest
armies in the world combined -- more than the entire social production of the major-
ity of the world's people.

The United States props up client states around the world to serve as extensions of
our power, while those states despotically subjugate their own people and their
neighbors, subjecting them to exploitation and oppression to suit our selfish ends.

If we ever held it, given our history of genocide and slavery, our nation has aban-
doned the moral high ground. It is only blind arrogance that causes some of us to still
believe that we are the world's greatest hope for freedom and democracy. We objec-
tively take a back seat to the people's struggles in the southern hemisphere and the
struggles of laboring people worldwide.

So now comes the question, "What shall we do?" "What do we need?" "Where will
we fit in?" While my list is nowhere near complete, I offer the following as some of
the needs that we face as a people and as a movement. I offer these as challenges to
all of us and we must decide what responsibilities we will accept:

We need people who have the capacity and the willingness to stand firmly with the
masses of the people and stand for the people.

We need people who have the capacity and willingness to speak out for and give
voice to the voiceless.

We need people to not only defend but to also empower the powerless.

We need people to not only protect and advocate for but also to organize the unor-
ganized to be a powerful voice of their own.
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We need people to not only explain to the uninformed but also to educate them into
their own creative understanding.

We need people to stand for the whole and to speak truth to power. We need to
struggle for the dissolution of dominating power. We need to learn again how to
come together in harmonious relationships to ourselves and the world.

These unusual times require unusual dedication and unusual effort to engage the
world in transformation away from its current path toward destruction at the hands of
the corrupt power that now dominates life here.

These are the challenges presented to us by this developing empire.

Thank you for giving me the opportunity to speak to you today.
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A Dedicated Thanks

2001

This is
To all the ancestors.

It is
To the forefathers

And the foremothers.
It is

To the storytellers
And to the teachers.

It is
To the fighters,

To the victims who persevered,
To the survivors.

It is
To those who dreamed

And shared their dreams with others.
It is

To all those who found their own way
To resist oppression:

You have lifted us up
So that we can see
Over the horizon.

From here, we can see
Past the rising sun.
Now we must do
What we must do,

And hold aloft
Those who will follow.
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Please contact me with your comments or criticisms:
elwhit@earthlink.net

Edward L. Whitfield


